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Date: June 25, 2025

Frank A. Nastasi, City Manager

From: Robert J. Bruner, Deputy City Manager

Chris Wilson, Assistant City Manager

Kyle Vieth Controller

Kurt Bovensiep, Public Works Director

Dennis Trantham, Deputy Public Works Director
Emily Frontera, Purchasing Manager

Subject: Standard Purchasing Resolution 2: Award to Low Bidder Meeting Specifications —

Disposable HVAC Filters

History

The Facilities Division is responsible for preventative maintenance for all HYAC equipment
including filter changes at all City facilities.

Filters are replaced based on the recommended interval established by the manufacturer.
To allow for ease in purchasing filters as needed, improved delivery, and to secure the best
pricing, a request for bid was solicited.

Purchasing

On June 5, 2025 a bid opening was conducted as required by the City Charter/Code for two (2) year
requirements of Disposable HVAC Filters with an option to renew for two (2) additional years.

e The bid was posted on the MITN Purchasing Group website; www.bidnetdirect.com//city-of-troy-mi.
e Four hundred and ninety-one (491) vendors were notified via the MITN website.
e Six (6) bids were received as well as one (1) no bid.
e Below is a detailed summary of potential vendors for the bid opportunity:
Companies notified via MITN 491 MITN provides a resourceful online platform to streamline the procurement
process, reduce costs, and make it easier and more transparent for vendors to
i e i do business with the City of Troy.
Troy Companies notified via MITN 8 Active MITN members with a current membership and paying annual dues
f : : e . receive automatic electronic notification which allows instant access to Bids,
Troy Companies - Active email Notification 8 REPS and Quote opportunities with the City.
ine L . Active MITN non-paying members are responsible to monitor and check the
Troy Companles Active Free 0 MITN website for opportunities to do business with the City.
. . . Inactive MITN member status can occur when a company does not renew
Compames that viewed the bid 44 their account upon expiration. Inactive members cannot be notified of
Troy Companies that viewed the bid 1 solicitations or access any bid information.

Bid proposals were evaluated and to maintain product consistency, it is recommended to award a
single contract to the total low bidder meeting specifications; Midwest Air Filter, Inc. of Grand Rapids
MI at unit prices as detailed in the attached bid tabulation.


http://www.bidnetdirect.com/city-of-troy-mi

Standard Purchasing Resolution 2:  Award to Low Bidder Meeting Specifications – Disposable HVAC Filters



Suggested Resolution 

Resolution #2025-06



RESOLVED, That Troy City Council hereby AWARDS a two (2) year contract with an option to renew for one (1) additional two-year period for Disposable HVAC Filters to the total low bidder meeting specifications, Midwest Air Filters, Inc. of Grand Rapids, MI at unit prices contained in the bid tabulation opened June 5, 2025, a copy of which shall be ATTACHED to the original Minutes of this meeting; not to exceed budgetary limitations; contract to expire June 30, 2029. 



BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the award is CONTINGENT upon submission of properly executed bid and contract documents, including bonds, insurance certificates and all other specified requirements.





fronterae
File Attachment
FY26 Disposable HVAC Filters Res.docx
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Financial
Funds are budgeted and available in the various department operating budgets.

Recommendation

City Management recommends awarding a two (2) year contract with an option to renew for one (1)
additional two-year period for Disposable HVAC Filters to the overall low bidder meeting
specifications; Midwest Air Filter, Inc. of Grand Rapids, MI at unit prices contained in the bid
tabulation opened June 5, 2025; not to exceed budgetary limitations; contract to expire June 30,
2029.




Opening Date: 06/05/2025
Date Reviewed: 06/05/2025

VENDOR NAME:

TO PROVIDE TWO (2) YEAR REQUIRMENTS OF DISPOSABLE HVAC FILTERS

YEAR RENEWAL

CITY OF TROY

BID TABULATION
DISPOSABLE HVAC FILTERS

Aero Filter Inc.

Filterbuy, Inc.

ITB-COT 25-11
Page 1 of 8

Florence Filter Corporation

CITY:

Madison Hgts., Ml

Talladega, AL

Compton, CA

FOR THE CITY OF TROY, WITH AN OPTION TO RENEW FOR ONE ADDITIONAL TWO (2)

PROPOSAL A - CITY HALL

# Size in Inches Est. Price Price Price
Item Units Description Qty Each Total Each Total Each Total
1 | AHU-1 (3) |SC4D21224CI 12 X 24 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10
AHU-3 (3) 6 $3.84 $23.04 $4.56 $27.36 $5.47 $32.82
2 | AHU-1(9) |SC4D22424CI24 X 24 X2 STD CAP MERV 10
AHU-2 (12) 30 $5.78 $173.40 $5.89 $176.70 $7.15 $214.50
AHU-3 (9)
3 [ AHU-1(3)
AHU-3 (3) |RF85P1224SFTCI 12 X 24 X 12 RIGID CELL 85S HFT
M14 AFPP855-2412HGS2: PLASTIC FRAME: 6 $52.58 $315.48 $52.78 $316.68 $54.45 $326.70
HEADER; SIDE GASKET ON 1-12IN & 1-24IN
4 | AHU-1(9) |RF85P1244SF4Cl 24 X 24 X 12 RIGID CELL 85S HF4
AHU-2 (12) |M14; AFPP85S-4412HGS PLASTIC FRAME; 68.39 2,051.70 60.08 1,802.40 79.20 2,376.00
AHU_3((9)) HEADER; SIDE GASKET ON 1 24IN DIMENSION 30 $68. $2,051. $60. $1,802. $79. $2,376.
5 AHU-3  [MVH28759229213GD20M2MA 11.38 X 23.38 X 11.50
99.99% HEPA FD; MVH SERIES 12-PANEL;
MICROGLASS FIBER; GALVANIZED STEEL FRAME; 3 $365.15 $1,095.45 NO BID $173.25 $519.75
DOWNSTREAM GASKET; 1002176
6 AHU-3
MVH59259229213GD40M2MA 23.38 X 23.38 X 11.50
99.99% HEPA FD; MVH SERIES 12-PANEL; 9 $427.35 $3,846.15 NO BID $106.43 $957.87
MICROGLASS FIBER; GALVANIZED STEEL FRAME;
DOWNSTREAM GASKET; 1002136 WTC ADD-LTL
7 AHU-5  [2PN1200240 12.00 X 24.00 2 PLY PANEL 6 $4.47 $26.82 $5.98 $35.88 $7.68 $46.08
8 AHU-5  [2PN2400240 24.00 X 24.00 2 PLY PANEL 15 $5.79 $86.85 $6.86 $102.90 $9.16 $137.40
9 AHU-5 [BG85S03XX1524SXXXXAF 12 X 24 X 15 BAG 85S 3P
SH M14 AFB385S2415 WTC FA-TL 6 $19.50 $117.00 $34.95 $209.70 $21.04 $126.24
10 [ AHU-5 [BGB85S06XX1544SXXXXAF 24 X 24 X 15 BAG 85S 6P
SH M14 AFB685S4415 WTC FATL 15 $30.52 $457.80 $39.48 $592.20 $21.54 $323.10
Manufacturer: AirFlow Prdts/ Mikropor Filterbuy Florence Filter Corporation
PROPOSAL A TOTAL: $8,193.69 $3,263.82 $5,060.46
PROPOSAL B - POLICE
1 | RTU-T (24) [SC4D21224CI 12 X 24 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
RTU-2 (24) |[BACK 48 $3.84 $184.32 $4.56 $218.88 $5.47 $262.56
2 RTU-3~ [SC4D22424CI 24 X 24 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
BACK 6 $5.78 $34.68 $5.89 $35.34 $7.15 $42.90
3 RTU-4  [SC4D22025CI 20 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
BACK 4 $5.31 $21.24 $5.55 $22.20 $6.51 $26.04
4 | ACU-1 (1) [SC4D11620CI 16 X 20 X1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
ACU-2 (1) |BACK
ACU-4 (1) 4 $3.84 $15.36 $4.14 $16.56 $4.69 $18.76
ACU-5 (1)
5 ACU-3 [SC4D11625CI 16 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
BACK 1 $4.27 $4.27 $4.52 $4.52 $5.19 $5.19
6 | Dispatch [SC4D42020CI 20 X 20 X 4 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 2 $8.59 $17.18 $7.17 $14.34 $11.31 $22.62
Equipment [BACK ) i ) i ) i
7 FPBs Sgé? 2025C120 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE [ g $4.75 $23.75 $4.94 $24.70 $5.99 $29.95
8 | PD Garage [SC4D21625CI
Unit Heater |16 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE BACK 2 $4.69 $9.38 $4.92 $9.84 $5.99 $11.98
Manufacturer: AirFlow Prdts Filterbuy FFC & Columbus
PROPOSAL B TOTAL: $310.18 $346.38 $420.00
PROPOSAL C - DISTRICT 52-4 COURT
1 | RTU-1(10) |2PN2400240 20 $5.79 $115.80 $6.86 $137.20 $9.16 $183.20
RTU-2 (10) |24.00 X 24.00 2 PLY PANEL
2 | RTU-1(5) [2PN1200240
RTU.2 (5) |12.00 X 24.00 2 PLY PANEL 10 $4.47 $44.70 $5.98 $59.80 $7.68 $76.80
3 | RTU-T(10) [MP11A0444NXXDXXGF 24 X 24 X 4 MINIPLEAT M11
RTU-2 (10) [PURII242446 DIE CUT FRAME; MICROGLASS 20 $71.57 $1,502.97 $57.46 $1,149.20 $72.31 $1,446.20
MEDIA; BOX WTC ADD-LTL
4 | RTU-T(3) [MP11A0424NXXDXXGF 12 X 24 X 4 MINIPLEAT M11
RTU-2 (5) |PURIIM22446 DIE CUT FRAME; MICROGLASS 10 $52.05 $624.60 $29.09 $290.90 $47.16 $471.60
MEDIA; BOX WTC ADD-LTL
5 RTU-3  [SCDC-AF10-0300-0399 AF 4IN SINGLE STD CAP
PLEAT 15.38 X 23.38 X 4 SC PLEAT AFP2000-04399 | 24 $18.92 $454.08 $9.34 $224.16 $13.50 $324.00
EXACT
6 RT,UT3 Fresh [PS20201NSF 20 x 20 x 1 Perm-A-Steel Mesh 20 $25.75 $515.00 NO BID $47.33 $946.60
airintake  |Galvanized
Note: Line 3 Qty 21
Line 4 Qty 12
Manufacturer: Airflow/Glasfloss/Smith Filter Filterbuy FFC & Columbus
PROPOSAL C TOTAL: $3,257.15 $1,861.26 $3,448.40




CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

DISPOSABLE HVAC FILTERS

ITB-COT 25-11
Page 2 of 8

VENDOR NAME: Aero Filter Inc. Filterbuy, Inc. Florence Filter Corporation
PROPOSAL D - LIBRARY
# Size in Inches Est. Price Price Price
Item Units Description Qty Each Total Each Total Each Total
1 | RTU-T(4) |SC4D21625CI 16 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10
RTU-6 (2) |WIRE BACK 8 $4.69 $37.52 $4.92 $39.36 $5.99 $47.92
RTU-10 (2)
2 | RTU-2 (12) [SC4D22020CI 20 X 20 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
RTU-7 (4) |BACK
RTU-8 (4) 28 $4.64 $129.92 $4.97 $139.16 $5.99 $167.72
RTU-9 (4)
3 RTU-3 3240?(22424(:' 24 X24 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 6 $5.78 $34.68 $5.89 $35.34 $7.15 $42.90
4 Elbj_-g ((:)) \?VCIIiEZI;ASéf(Cl 18 X24 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 8 $5.03 $40.24 $5.34 $42.72 $7.41 $59.28
5 AHU-T SC4D42424C1 24 X 24 X 4 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 10 $11.14 $111.40 $8.51 $85.10 $13.39 $133.90
Basement |BACK
6 AHU-T SC4D41224C1 12 X 24 X 4 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 5 $6.69 $33.45 $6.40 $32.00 $9.61 $48.05
Basement |BACK
7 Furnance |AC5TR47196242M10CI 20 X 25 X 5 AIR BEAR M10 1
Basement |AFP3000-20255M10 GASKET ON TOP & BOTTOM: $16.44 $16.44 $12.39 $12.39 $46.62 $46.62
ACTUAL SIZE: 19.75 X 24.25X 4.88
8 Elevator |SC4D11625CI 16 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Lobby BACK 1 $4.27 $4.27 $4.52 $4.52 $5.19 $5.19
9 | cond SC4D11520CI 15 X 20 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
ondenser |5\~ 1 $3.86 $3.86 $4.45 $4.45 $5.85 $5.85
Manufacturer: AirFlow Prdts Filterbuy FFC & Columbus
PROPOSAL D TOTAL: $411.78 $395.04 $557.43
PROPOSAL E - COMMUNITY CENTER
1 RTU-1 (8) |24 X24 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE BACK
RTU-2 (8)
RTU 3 (8) 40 $5.78 $231.20 $5.89 $235.60 $7.15 $286.00
RTU-5 (8)
RTU-6 (8)
2 RTU-4 324(:?(212240 12 X24 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 24 $3.84 $92.16 $4.56 $100.44 $5.47 $131.28
3 ERV-5 SC4D21620CI 16 X 20 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 4
BACK $4.12 $16.48 $4.04 $16.16 $5.47 $21.88
4 | ERV-1 (14) |SC4D21625CI 16 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
ERV-2 (14) |BACK 28 $4.69 $131.32 $4.92 $137.76 $5.99 $167.72
5 | RTU-7 (12) [SC4D22024C1 20 X 24 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
RTU-8 (12) |BACK 36 $5.21 $187.56 $5.73 $206.28 $6.51 $234.36
RTU-9 (12)
6 ERV-3 (6) |SC4D22025CI 20 X 25 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
ERV-4 (6) [BACK
MAU (4)
ERV-6 (6) 40 $5.31 $212.40 $5.55 $222.00 $6.51 $260.40
ERV-7 (6)
ERV-8 (6)
ERV-9 (6)
7 RTU-1(8) |MP11A0444NXXDXXGF 24 X 24 X 4 MINIPLEAT M11
RTU-2 (8) [BXPURII242446 DIE CUT FRAME; MICROGLASS
RTU-3 (8) [MEDIA; BOXWTC ADD-LTL 40 $71.57 $3,005.94 $57.46 $2,298.40 $72.31 $2,892.40
RTU-5 (8)
RTU-6 (8)
8 RTU-4 [MP11A0424NXXDXXGF 12 X 24 X 4 MINIPLEAT M11
BX PURII122446 DIE CUT FRAME; MICROGLASS
MEDIA: BOX: Q#RFTNC060122B E-12/31/22WTC 24 $52.05 $1,249.20 $29.09 $698.16 $47.16 $1,131.84
ADD-LTL
9 DHU 224&41224@ 12X 24 X4 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 24 $6.69 $160.56 $6.40 $153.60 $9.61 $230.64
10 VAV TA10HX-CA-0300-0399 CA SINGLE POLY-FIBER 1IN
17.38 X 21.75 X 1 POLY T/A SINGLE POLY EXACT 18 $6.74 $121.32 $4.42 $79.56 $5.99 $107.82
WTC ADD-LTL
1 VAV TA10HX-CA-0100-0149 CA SINGLE POLY-FIBER 1IN
9.88 X 13.50 X 1 POLY T/A SINGLE POLY EXACT 2 $5.90 $11.80 $1.57 $3.14 $4.94 $9.88
WTC ADD-LTL
12 VAV TA10HX-CA-0250-0299 CA SINGLE POLY-FIBER 1IN
14.88 X 17.38 X 1 POLY T/A SINGLE POLY EXACT 7 $7.14 $49.98 $3.03 $21.21 $5.83 $40.81
WTC FA-TL
13 VAV TA10HX-CA-0150-0199 CA SINGLE POLY-FIBER 1IN
12.38 X 15.50 X 1 POLY T/A SINGLE POLY EXACT 5 $6.77 $33.85 $2.25 $11.25 $5.58 $27.90
WTC ADD-LTL
14 VAV TA10HX-CA-0150-0199 CA SINGLE POLY-FIBER 1IN
8.00 X 19.00 X 1 POLY T/A SINGLE POLY EXACT 1 $6.56 $6.56 $1.78 $1.78 $5.10 $5.10
WTC ADD-LTL
15 VAV TSM12020CI 20 X 20 X 1 POLY MONO T/A 2 $4.03 $8.06 $3.32 $6.64 $5.93 $11.86
Note: Line 7 Qty 42
Manufacturer: AirFlow Prdts/Glasfloss/AirRite Filterbuy FFC & Columbus
PROPOSAL E TOTAL: $5,518.39 $4,200.98 $5,559.89
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VENDOR NAME: Aero Filter Inc. Filterbuy, Inc. Florence Filter Corporation
# Size in Inches Est. Price Price Price
Item Units Description Qty Each Total Each Total Each Total
PROPOSAL F - TRAINING CENTER
1 RTU1-6 SgéiZZOZOCI 20X20 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 24 $4.64 $111.36 $4.97 $119.28 $5.99 $143.76
Manufacturer: AirFlow Prdts Filterbuy FFC & Columbus
PROPOSAL F TOTAL: $111.36 $119.28 $143.76
PROPOSAL G - FIRE STATION 1-6
1 FS 1(1) |AC5TR47196242M10CI 20 X 25 X 5 AIR BEAR M10
FS 2 (1) |AFP3000-20255M10 GASKET ON TOP & BOTTOM,; 4 16.44 65.76 12.39 49.56 46.62 186.48
FS5(1) |ACTUAL SIZE: 19.75 X 24.25 X 4.88 $16. $6s. $12. $49. $48. $186.
FS6(1)
2 FS 1(1) |SC4D11825CI 18 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Electrical |BACK 1 $4.78 $4.78 $4.91 $4.91 $5.19 $5.19
3 FS 3(3) |SC4D11625CI 16 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
BACK 3 $4.27 $12.81 $4.52 $13.56 $5.19 $15.57
4 FS4@) SgéimGZOCI 16 X20 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 4 $4.12 $16.48 $4.04 $16.16 $5.47 $21.88
5 FS 4 (4) |SC4D22025CI 20 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
BACK 4 $5.31 $21.24 $5.55 $22.20 $6.51 $26.04
6 FS 4 (4) 224(3?(22020@ 20 X 20 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 4 $4.64 $18.56 $4.97 $19.88 $5.99 $23.96
7 gfﬂ}iﬁ) :r'sr 3PN2400240 24.00 X 24.00 3 PLY PANEL 36 $5.79 $208.44 $6.86 $246.96 $9.16 $329.76
Manufacturer: AirFlow Prdts Filterbuy FFC & Columbus
PROPOSAL G TOTAL: $348.07 $373.23 $608.88
PROPOSAL H - DWA
1 RTU 1 (4) [SC4D22025CI 20 X 25 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
RTU 2 (4) |BACK
RTU 3 (4) 22 $5.31 $116.82 $5.55 $122.10 $6.51 $143.22
Winter Garage
(10)
2 [ RTU4 (4) [SC4D21620CI 16 X 20 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
RTU5(2) |BACK 8 $4.12 $32.96 $4.04 $32.32 $5.47 $43.76
3 | PG Office (1) [SC4D11625CI 16 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Fac Stor (1) |IBACK 3 $4.27 $12.81 $4.52 $13.56 $5.19 $15.57
Keyroom (1)
4 | PG Office (1) |SC4D11420Cl 14 X 20 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
BACK 1 $3.93 $3.93 $4.24 $4.24 $5.20 $5.20
5 | DPW Lounge [SC4D11224Cl 12 X 24 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
BACK 3 $3.79 $11.37 $4.34 $13.02 $4.56 $13.68
6 | DPW Fleet 224(3?(216250 16 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 30 $4.69 $140.70 $4.92 $147.60 $5.99 $179.70
Manufacturer: AirFlow Prdts Filterbuy FFC & Columbus
PROPOSAL H TOTAL: $318.59 $332.84 $401.13
PROPOSAL | - HISTORIC VILLAGE
1 Caswell [SC4D12020CI 20 X 20 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10
WIRE BACK 1 $4.27 $4.27 $3.99 $3.99 $5.19 $5.19
2 Barnard |SC4D22020CI 20 X 20 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
BACK 2 $4.64 $9.28 $4.97 $9.94 $5.99 $11.98
3 Main SCDA-AF10-0400-0499 19.75 X 21.75 X 1 EXACT
SIZE STD CAP MERV 10 PLEAT 1 $9.65 $9.65 $6.73 $6.73 $7.53 $7.53
4 Main SC4D11425Cl1 14 X 25 X1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
BACK 1 $4.32 $4.32 $4.63 $4.63 $5.20 $5.20
5 | Print Shop [SC4D11620CI 16 X 20 X1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
BACK 1 $3.84 $3.84 $4.14 $4.14 $4.69 $4.69
6 | Barnard (1) [SC4D11625CI 16 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Caswell (1) |BACK
Town Hall 4 $4.27 $17.08 $4.52 $18.08 $5.19 $20.76
Gen Store (1)
7 | Poppleton [SC4D12025CI 20 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
BACK 2 $4.75 $9.50 $4.94 $9.88 $5.99 $11.98
8 [ Barnard (1) [SC4D42025CI 20 X 25 X 4 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Church (2) |BACK
Gen Store (1) 5 $9.52 $47.60 $7.98 $39.90 $13.12 $65.60
Parsonage (1)
Manufacturer: AirFlow Prdts Filterbuy FFC & Columbus
PROPOSAL | TOTAL: $105.54 $97.29 $132.93
PROPOSAL J - NATURE CENTER
1 F1(1) SC4D11824C1 18 X 24 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Eg 8; BACK 4 $4.69 $18.76 $4.95 $19.80 $6.37 $25.48
F6 (1)
2 F2 (1) SC4D11620CI 16 X 20 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
F3 (1) BACK 2 $3.84 $7.68 $4.14 $8.28 $4.69 $9.38
Manufacturer: AirFlow Prdts Filterbuy FFC & Columbus
PROPOSAL J TOTAL: $26.44 $28.08 $34.86
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VENDOR NAME: Aero Filter Inc. Filterbuy, Inc. Florence Filter Corporation
# Size in Inches Est. Price Price Price
Item Units Description Qty Each Total Each Total Each Total
PROPOSAL K - SYLVAN GLEN
1 | RTU-1MB SgéﬁﬂGZSCI 16 X 25 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 2 $4.60 $9.38 $4.92 $9.84 $5.99 $11.98
2 F2 MB 324(:?(116250 16 x 25 x 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 1 $4.27 $4.27 $4.52 $4.52 $5.19 $5.19
3 Pro Shop [SC4D12025CI 20 x 25 x 1 STD CAP MERV 10
WIRE BACK 2 $4.75 $9.50 $4.94 $9.88 $5.99 $11.98
Manufacturer: AirFlow Prdts Filterbuy FFC & Columbus
PROPOSAL K TOTAL: $23.15 $24.24 $29.15
PROPOSAL L - SANCTUARY LAKE
1 Pro Shop (1) |SC4D11625CI 16 x 25 x 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 2 $4.27 $8.54 $4.52 $9.04 $5.19 $10.38
Pub (1) BACK
2 | Kitchen (1) RT [SC4D12020CI 20 x 20 x 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Clubhouse (4) |BACK 5 $4.27 $21.35 $3.99 $19.95 $5.19 $25.95
3 | FMB Attic [SC4D11424Cl 14 x 24 x 1 STD CAP MERV 10
AFP2000-1424 1 $4.27 $4.27 $4.58 $4.58 $5.20 $5.20
Manufacturer: AirFlow Prdts Filterbuy FFC & Columbus
PROPOSAL L TOTAL: $34.16 $33.57 $41.53
PROPOSAL M - TRANSIT CENTER
1 [ Mechanical |SC4D11624Cl 16 X 24 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Room BACK 1 $4.32 $4.32 $4.81 $4.81 $5.19 $5.19
2 Bridge |SC4D12025CI 20 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
EastWest |BACK 2 $4.75 $9.50 $4.94 $9.88 $5.99 $11.98
3 Stairway [2PN1000330 10 x 33 2 PLY PANEL 2 $5.23 $10.46 $10.72 $21.44 $8.06 $16.12
Stairway [2PN1000200 10 X 20 2 PLY PANEL 1 $5.09 $5.09 $5.33 $5.33 $6.87 $6.87
Manufacturer: AirFlow Prdts Filterbuy FFC & Columbus
PROPOSAL M TOTAL.: $29.37 $41.46 $40.16
GRAND TOTAL ALL ITEMS: $18,687.87 $11,117.47 $16,478.58
PROPOSAL N - MISC FILTERS
DISCOUNT ON ALL OTHER FILTERS NOT LISTED: 0% 22% 50%
MANUFACTURER N/A Filterbuy Florence Filter Corporation
Delivery and Tage Requirements Initialed: Y or N Y Y Y
Materials/Services Prices Guaranteed: Y or N Y Y Y
Method of Delivery: Aero Filter Truck UPS FedEx and other carriers as needed
Box Removal Requirement Initialed: Y or N Y Y Y
Authorized Dealer: Y or N Y Y Y
Contact Information Provided: Y or N Y Y Y
Product Literature Provided: Y or N Y Y Y
Test Information Provided: Y or N N Y Y
References: Y or N Y Y Y
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 0% 30 Days
90 day refund policy. Refunds on
Warranty: Not Specified custom orders only if Filterbuy error. See the Attached
Delivery Date: Not Specified 1 -4 Weeks ARO From 3 days to 1 days of the PO
We are offering MERV 11 pleated filters
instead of MERV 10 based on
availability. Unsure whether Poly T/A
filters should have cardboard frame; we
Exceptions: None are offering poly pads (M8) None
All or Nothing Award: Y or N N N N
Acknowledgement Signed: Y or N Y Y Y
Forms: Y or N Y Y Y
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VENDOR NAME:| International Filtration Services Koch Filter Corporation Midwest Air Filter, Inc.
CITY: Belleville, M| Louisville, KY Grand Rapids, Ml
TO PROVIDE TWO (2) YEAR REQUIRMENTS OF DISPOSABLE HVAC FILTERS FOR THE CITY OF TROY, WITH AN OPTION TO RENEW FOR ONE ADDITIONAL TWO (2)
YEAR RENEWAL
PROPOSAL A - CITY HALL
# Size in Inches Est. Price Price Price
Item Units Description Qty Each Total Each Total Each Total
1 ﬁ:tj; ((:;)) SC4D21224C1 12 X 24 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 6 $4.51 $27.06 $4.26 $25.56 $2.78 $16.68
2 | AHU-1(9) |SC4D22424Cl 24 X 24 X2 STD CAP MERV 10
AHU-2 (12) 30 $5.36 $160.80 $5.96 $178.80 $4.33 $129.90
AHU-3 (9)
3 | AHU-1(3) |RF85P1224SFTCI 12 X 24 X 12 RIGID CELL 85S HFT
AHU-3 (3) [M14 AFPP85S-2412HGS2; PLASTIC FRAME; 6 $100.56 $603.36 $76.77 $460.62 $44.70 $268.20
HEADER; SIDE GASKET ON 1-12IN & 1-24IN
4 | AHU-1(9) |RF85P1244SF4Cl 24 X 24 X 12 RIGID CELL 85S HF4
AHU-2 (12) |M14; AFPP85S-4412HGS PLASTIC FRAME; 30 $119.45 $3,583.50 $91.45 $2,743.50 $58.14 $1,744.20
AHU-3 (9) |HEADER; SIDE GASKET ON 1 24IN DIMENSION
5 AHU-3  [MVH28759229213GD20M2MA 11.38 X 23.38 X 11.50
99.99% HEPA FD; MVH SERIES 12-PANEL;
MICROGLASS FIBER: GALVANIZED STEEL FRAME: 3 $250.00 $750.00 $515.60 $1,546.80 $186.89 $560.67
DOWNSTREAM GASKET; 1002176
6 AHU-3  |MVH59259229213GD40M2MA 23.38 X 23.38 X 11.50
99.99% HEPA FD; MVH SERIES 12-PANEL;
MICROGLASS FIBER: GALVANIZED STEEL FRAME: 9 $300.00 $2,700.00 $491.27 $4,421.43 $261.34 $2,352.06
DOWNSTREAM GASKET; 1002136 WTC ADD-LTL
7 AHU-5  |2PN1200240 12.00 X 24.00 2 PLY PANEL 6 $4.52 $27.12 $5.00 $30.00 $3.34 $20.04
8 AHU-5  |2PN2400240 24.00 X 24.00 2 PLY PANEL 15 $6.16 $92.40 $6.38 $95.70 $3.80 $57.00
9 AHU-5 |BG85S03XX1524SXXXXAF 12 X 24 X 15 BAG 85S 3P
SH M14 AFB385S2415 WTC FA-TL 6 $16.04 $96.24 $22.43 $134.58 $16.58 $99.48
10 AHU-5 |BG85S06XX1544SXXXXAF 24 X 24 X 15 BAG 85S 6P
SH M14 AFB685S4415 WTC FA-TL 15 $25.54 $383.10 $72.64 $1,089.60 $25.94 $389.10
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense/Filtration Group/Northland
PROPOSAL A TOTAL: $8,423.58 $10,726.59 $5,637.33
PROPOSAL B - POLICE
1 | RTU-1(24) |sC4D21224CI 12 X 24 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
4.51 216.48 4.26 204.48 2.78 133.44
RTU-2 (24) [BACK 48 $ $ $ $ 0 0
2 RTU-3 Sgéﬁ224Z4CI 24 X 24 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 6 $5.36 $32.16 $5.96 $35.76 $4.33 $25.98
RTU-4
3 SgéﬁZZOZSCI 20 X 25 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 4 $5.00 $20.36 $5.46 $21.84 $3.78 $15.12
4 | ACU-1(1) |SC4D11620CI 16 X 20 X1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
ACU-2(1) |BACK 4 $4.47 $17.88 $4.13 $16.52 $2.55 $10.20
ACU-4 (1) . . . . . .
ACU-5 (1)
5 ACU-3 224(3&1 1625C1 16 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 1 $4.57 $4.57 $4.37 $4.37 $2.99 $2.99
6 Dispatch [SC4D42020CI 20 X 20 X4 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Equipment |BACK 2 $8.33 $16.66 $9.50 $19.00 $6.51 $13.02
SC4D12025CI1 20 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
7 FPBs BACK 5 $4.66 $23.30 $4.95 $24.75 $3.40 $17.00
8 | PD Garage |SC4D21625ClI
. 4.80 9.60 4.83 9.66 3.41 6.82
Unit Heater [16 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE BACK 2 $ $ $ $ $ $
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense
PROPOSAL B TOTAL: $341.01 $336.38 $224.57
PROPOSAL C - DISTRICT 52-4 COURT
1 | RTU-1(10) |2PN2400240 20 $6.16 $123.20 $6.38 $127.60 $3.80 $76.00
RTU-2 (10) |124.00 X 24.00 2 PLY PANEL
2 | RTU-1(5) [2PN1200240
RTU-2 (5) |12.00 X 24.00 2 PLY PANEL 10 $4.52 $45.20 $5.00 $50.00 $3.34 $33.40
3 | RTU-1 (10) [MP11A0444NXXDXXGF 24 X 24 X 4 MINIPLEAT M11
RTU-2 (10) |PURII242446 DIE CUT FRAME; MICROGLASS 20 $79.96 $1,599.20 $81.13 $1,622.60 $54.89 $1,097.80
MEDIA; BOX WTC ADD-LTL
4 | RTU-1(5) |MP11A0424NXXDXXGF 12 X 24 X 4 MINIPLEAT M11
RTU-2 (5) |PURII122446 DIE CUT FRAME; MICROGLASS 10 $63.75 $637.50 $54.94 $549.40 $34.57 $345.70
MEDIA; BOX WTC ADD-LTL
5 RTU-3 |SCDC-AF10-0300-0399 AF 4IN SINGLE STD CAP
PLEAT 15.38 X 23.38 X 4 SC PLEAT AFP2000-04399 | 24 $8.21 $197.04 $13.16 $315.84 $7.18 $172.32
EXACT
6 | RTU-3 Fresh [PS20201NSF 20 x 20 x 1 Perm-A-Steel Mesh
air intake Galvanized 20 $25.57 $511.40 $28.79 $575.80 $19.28 $385.60
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense/Filtration Group/Smith
PROPOSAL C TOTAL: $3,113.54 $3,241.24 $2,110.82
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VENDOR NAME:|  International Filtration Services |  Koch Filter Corporation Midwest Air Filter, Inc.
PROPOSAL D - LIBRARY
# Size in Inches Est. Price Price Price
Item Units Description Qty Each Total Each Total Each Total
1 RTU-1 (4) |SC4D21625CI 16 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10
RTU-6 (2) |WIRE BACK 8 $4.80 $38.40 $4.83 $38.64 $3.41 $27.28
RTU-10 (2)
2 | RTU-2 (12) [SC4D22020CI 20 X 20 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
B BACK
RTU-7 (4) 28 $4.80 $134.40 $4.84 $135.52 $3.41 $95.48
RTU-8 (4)
RTU-9 (4)
3 | RTU3 224(:?(224240 24X24 X2 STD CAP MERVAOWIRE | g $5.36 $32.16 $5.96 $35.76 $4.33 $25.98
4 RTU-4 (4) [SC4D21824Cl 18 X 24 X2 STD CAP MERV 10
RTU-5 (4) WIRE BACK 8 $4.89 $39.12 $5.79 $46.32 $3.78 $30.24
5 AHU-1 SC4D42424Cl1 24 X 24 X4 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 10 $9.42 $94.20 $11.19 $111.90 $8.04 $80.40
Basement |BACK
6 AHU-1 SC4D41224Cl1 12 X 24 X4 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 5 $7.62 $38.10 $8.32 $41.60 $5.07 $25.35
Basement |BACK
7 Furnance |AC5TR47196242M10CI 20 X 25 X 5 AIR BEAR M10 1
Basement |AFP3000-20255M10 GASKET ON TOP & BOTTOM: $41.29 $41.29 $25.12 $25.12 lmE LizeE
8 Elevator |SC4D11625CI 16 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Lobby BACK 1 $4.57 $4.57 $4.37 $4.37 $2.99 $2.99
SC4D11520CI 15 X 20 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
9 | Condenser BACK 1 $4.63 $4.63 $5.20 $5.20 $2.71 $2.71
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense
PROPOSAL D TOTAL: $426.87 $444.43 $302.45
PROPOSAL E - COMMUNITY CENTER
1 RTU-1 (8) [SC4D22424ClI
RTU-2 (8) |24 X24 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE BACK
RTU 3 (8) 40 $5.36 $214.40 $5.96 $238.40 $4.33 $173.20
RTU-5 (8)
RTU-6 (8)
2| RTU4 224&212240| 12X24 X2 STD CAP MERVIOWIRE | 5, $4.51 $108.24 $4.26 $102.24 $2.78 $66.72
3 ERV-5 SC4D21620CI 16 X 20 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
BACK 4 $4.60 $18.40 $4.30 $17.20 $2.95 $11.80
4 | ERV-1 (14) |SC4D21625CI 16 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
28 4.80 134.40 4.83 135.24 3.41 95.48
ERV-2 (14) |BACK s $ s $ i ¥
5 | RTU-7 (12) [SC4D22024CI 20 X 24 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
RTU-8 (12) [BACK 36 $5.03 $181.08 $5.56 $200.16 $3.78 $136.08
RTU-9 (12)
6 ERV-3 (6) |SC4D22025CI 20 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
ERV-4 (6) |BACK
MAU (4)
ERV-6 (6) 40 $5.09 $203.60 $5.46 $218.40 $3.78 $151.20
ERV-7 (6)
ERV-8 (6)
ERV-9 (6)
7 RTU-1(8) |MP11A0444NXXDXXGF 24 X 24 X 4 MINIPLEAT M11
RTU-2 (8) |BX PURII242446 DIE CUT FRAME; MICROGLASS
RTU-3 (8) |MEDIA; BOX WTC ADD-LTL 40 $79.96 $3,198.40 $125.22 $5,008.80 $56.79 $2,271.60
RTU-5 (8)
RTU-6 (8)
8 RTU-4 [MP11A0424NXXDXXGF 12 X 24 X 4 MINIPLEAT M11
BX PURII122446 DIE CUT FRAME; MICROGLASS
MEDIA: BOX: Q#RFTNCO060122B E-12/31/22WTC 24 $63.75 $1,530.00 $106.10 $2,546.40 $34.57 $829.68
ADD-LTL
9 DHU 224&412240| 12X 24 X4 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 24 $7.62 $182.88 $8.32 $199.68 $5.07 $121.68
10 VAV TA10HX-CA-0300-0399 CA SINGLE POLY-FIBER 1IN
17.38 X 21.75 X 1 POLY T/A SINGLE POLY EXACT 18 $4.52 $81.36 $7.40 $133.20 $3.33 $59.94
WTC ADD-LTL
1 VAV TA10HX-CA-0100-0149 CA SINGLE POLY-FIBER 1IN
9.88 X 13.50 X 1 POLY T/A SINGLE POLY EXACT 2 $4.70 $9.40 $6.83 $13.66 $2.85 $5.70
WTC ADD-LTL
12 VAV TA10HX-CA-0250-0299 CA SINGLE POLY-FIBER 1IN
14.88 X 17.38 X 1 POLY T/A SINGLE POLY EXACT 7 $5.87 $41.09 $7.07 $49.49 $3.38 $23.66
WTC FA-TL
13 VAV TA10HX-CA-0150-0199 CA SINGLE POLY-FIBER 1IN
12.38 X 15.50 X 1 POLY T/A SINGLE POLY EXACT 5 $5.17 $25.85 $6.83 $34.15 $3.14 $15.70
WTC ADD-LTL
14 VAV TA10HX-CA-0150-0199 CA SINGLE POLY-FIBER 1IN
8.00 X 19.00 X 1 POLY T/A SINGLE POLY EXACT 1 $5.17 $5.17 $6.83 $6.83 $2.96 $2.96
WTC ADD-LTL
15 VAV TSM12020CI 20 X 20 X 1 POLY MONO T/A 2 $4.29 $8.58 $2.41 $4.82 $2.90 $5.80
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense/Filtration Group
PROPOSAL E TOTAL: $5,942.85 $8,908.67 $3,971.20
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VENDOR NAME:| International Filtration Services Koch Filter Corporation Midwest Air Filter, Inc.
 # Size in Inches Est. Price Price Price
Item Units Description Qty Each Total Each Total Each Total
PROPOSAL F - TRAINING CENTER
1 | RTU 1-6 224&22020@ 20 X 20 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE | 24 $4.80 | $115.20 $4.84 | $116.16 $3.41 $81.84
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense
PROPOSAL F TOTAL: $115.20 $116.16 $81.84
PROPOSAL G - FIRE STATION 1-6
1 FST(T) [AC5TR47196242M10CI 20 X 25 X 5 AIR BEAR M10
FS2(1) [AFP3000-20255M10 GASKET ON TOP & BOTTOM;
' 4 41.29 165.16 25.12 100.48 12.02 48.08
FS5(1) [ACTUAL SIZE: 19.75 X 24.25 X 4.88 $ $ $ $ $ $
FS 6 (1)
2 FS 1 (1) SC4D11825CI 18 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Eleotrical Rm |BACK 1 $4.91 $4.91 $7.13 $7.13 $3.80 $3.80
3 FS 3 (3) 2240?(1 1625CI 16 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 3 $457 $13.71 $4.37 $13.11 $2.99 $8.97
SC4D21620CI 16 X 20 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
4 FS4(4) BACK 4 $4.60 $18.40 $4.30 $17.20 $2.95 $11.80
5 FS 4 (4) Sgéizzozsm 20 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 4 $5.00 $20.36 $5.46 $21.84 $3.78 $15.12
6 FS 4 (4) 224&22020@ 20 X 20 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 4 $4.80 $19.20 $4.84 $19.36 $3.41 $13.64
7 | FS1-6Air |3PN2400240 24.00 X 24.00 3 PLY PANEL 36 $6.78 $244.08 $7.78 $280.08 $4.80 $172.80
Scrubbers
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense
PROPOSAL G TOTAL: $485.82 $459.20 $274.21

PROPOSAL H - DWA

1 RTU 1 (4) [SC4D22025CI 20 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
RTU2(4) |BACK
RTU 3 (4) 22 $5.09 $111.98 $5.46 $120.12 $3.78 $83.16
Winter Garage
(10)

2 | RTU4(4) [SC4D21620CI 16 X 20 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE

RTU 5 (2) [BACK 8 $4.60 $36.80 $4.30 $34.40 $2.95 $23.60

3 | PG Office (1) |SC4D11625CI 16 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Fac Stor (1) [BACK 3 $4.57 $13.71 $4.37 $13.11 $2.99 $8.97
Keyroom (1)

4 | PG Office (1) |SC4D11420CI 14 X 20 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE

BACK 1 $4.40 $4.40 $4.78 $4.78 $2.31 $2.31
DPW L
5 ounge Sgé? 1224C112 X 24 X1 STD CAP MERVIOWIRE | 5 $4.40 $13.20 $4.93 $14.79 $2.60 $7.80
6 | DPW Fleet §§4CIE<216250I 16 X 25 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 30 $4.80 $144.00 $4.83 $144.90 $3.41 $102.30
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense
PROPOSAL H TOTAL: $324.09 $332.10 $228.14
PROPOSAL | - HISTORIC VILLAGE
1 Caswell [SC4D12020CI 20 X 20 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10
WIRE BACK 1 $4.58 $4.58 $4.40 $4.40 $2.90 $2.90
2 Barnard §§4CIE<220200I 20 X 20 X 2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 2 $4.80 $9.60 $4.84 $9.68 $3.41 $6.82
3 Main SCDA-AF10-0400-0499 19.75 X 21.75 X 1 EXACT
SIZE STD CAP MERV 10 PLEAT 1 $13.74 $13.74 $10.43 $10.43 $5.10 $5.10
4 Main 324(:&1 1425CI 14 X 25 X1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 1 $4.68 $4.68 $5.12 $5.12 $2.40 $2.40
5 | Print Shop [SC4D11620CI 16 X 20 X1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 1 $4.47 $4.47 $4.13 $4.13 $2.55 $2.55
oA . ’ . X ’ H
6 | Barnard (1) [SC4D11625CI 16 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Caswell (1) |[BACK
Town Hall 4 $4.57 $18.28 $4.37 $17.48 $2.99 $11.96
(1
Gen Store (1)
7 | Poppleton SgéﬁﬁOZSCI 20 X25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 2 $4.66 $9.32 $4.95 $9.90 $3.40 $6.80
8 | Barnard (1) [SC4D42025CI 20 X 25 X 4 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Church (2) |BACK 5 $8.94 $44.70 $10.80 $54.00 $6.75 $33.75
Gen Store (1)
Parsonage (1)
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense
PROPOSAL | TOTAL: $109.37 $115.14 $72.28
PROPOSAL J - NATURE CENTER
1 F1(1) SC4D11824C1 18 X 24 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
o 8; BACK 4 $4.60 $18.40 $6.38 $25.52 $3.50 $14.00
F6 (1)
F2 (1
2 [@) SC4D11620CI 16 X 20 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 2 $4.47 $8.94 $4.13 $8.26 $2.55 $5.10
F3(1) BACK
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense

PROPOSAL J TOTAL: $27.34 $33.78 $19.10
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VENDOR NAME: Services Koch Filter Corporation Midwest Air Filter, Inc.
# Size in Inches Est. Price Price Price
Item Units Description Qty Each Total Each Total Each Total
PROPOSAL K - SYLVAN GLEN
1 | RTU-1MB SgéﬁﬂGZSCI 16 X 25 X2 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 2 $4.80 $9.60 $4.83 $9.66 $3.41 $6.82
2 F2 MB §§4CIE<116250I 16 x 25 x 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE 1 $4.57 $4.57 $4.37 $4.37 $2.99 $2.99
3 Pro Shop [SC4D12025CI 20 x 25 x 1 STD CAP MERV 10
WIRE BACK 2 $4.66 $9.32 $4.95 $9.90 $3.40 $6.80
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense
PROPOSAL K TOTAL: $23.49 $23.93 $16.61
PROPOSAL L - SANCTUARY LAKE
Pro Shop (1) |SC4D11625CI 16 x 25 x 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
1| Proshor () Xeox 2 $4.57 $9.14 $4.37 $8.74 $2.99 $5.98
Pub (1) [BACK
Kitchen (1) RT |SC4D12020CI 20 x 20 x 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
2 | Kitchen (1) xeox 5 $4.58 $22.90 $4.40 $22.00 $2.91 $14.55
Clubhouse (4) |BACK
3 | FMB Attic [SC4D11424Cl 14 x 24 x 1 STD CAP MERV 10
AFP2000-1424 1 $4.66 $4.66 $6.66 $6.66 $2.40 $2.40
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense
PROPOSAL L TOTAL: $36.70 $37.40 $22.93
PROPOSAL M - TRANSIT CENTER
1 | Mechanical |SC4D11624Cl 16 X 24 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
Room __ [BACK 1 $4.74 $4.74 $6.71 $6.71 $2.95 $2.95
2 Bridge |SC4D12025CI 20 X 25 X 1 STD CAP MERV 10 WIRE
EastWest |BACK 2 $4.66 $9.32 $4.95 $9.90 $3.40 $6.80
3 Stairway [2PN1000330 10 x 33 2 PLY PANEL 2 $6.44 $12.88 $14.48 $28.96 $5.20 $10.40
4 Stairway [2PN1000200 10 X 20 2 PLY PANEL 1 $5.34 $5.34 $8.02 $8.02 $3.34 $3.34
Manufacturer: Mann & Hummel Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense
PROPOSAL M TOTAL.: $32.28 $53.59 $23.49
GRAND TOTAL ALL ITEMS: $19,402.14 $24,828.61 $12,984.97
PROPOSAL N - MISC FILTERS
DISCOUNT ON ALL OTHER FILTERS NOT LISTED: 45% 40% 75%
MANUFACTURER Mann & Hummel/IFS list price Koch Filter Corporation Air Defense
Delivery and Tage Requirements Initialed: Y or N Y Y Y
Materials/Services Prices Guaranteed: Y or N Y Y Y
Method of Delivery: Common Carrier Carrier Midwest Air Filter Truck
Box Removal Requirement Initialed: Y or N Y Y Y
Authorized Dealer: Y or N Y Y Y
Contact Information Provided: Y or N Y Y Y
Product Literature Provided: Y or N Y Y Y
Test Information Provided: Y or N N Y Y
References: Y or N Y Y Y
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Days Net 30
i Product that is found to be defective
90 days following the date of ] within 2 yrs from the date of purchase.
Warranty: See Attached delivery Limited to breakage only.
Stock - 6 weeks depending on
Delivery Date: filter Varies 1 -2 weeks
Exceptions: None None None
All or Nothing Award: Y or N N N N
Acknowledgement Signed: Y or N Y Y Y
Forms: Y or N Y Familial Disclosure not certified Y

No Bid: Filter King LLC
Attest:

(*Bid Opening conducted via a Zoom Meeting)

Laura Campbell
Andrew Chambliss
Nellie Bert

Dina Gates

Total Low Bidder Meeting Specifications

Emily Frontera

Purchasing Manager
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