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CCIITTYY  CCOOUUNNCCIILL  AAGGEENNDDAA  IITTEEMM  
 

 
Date:  June 9, 2020 
 
To:   Mark F. Miller, City Manager 
 
From:  Robert J. Bruner, Assistant City Manager 
  Lisa Burnham, Accounting Manager 
  Kurt Bovensiep, Public Works Director 
  Brian Varney, Fleet Operations Manager 

MaryBeth Murz, Purchasing Manager 
 
Subject: Standard Purchasing Resolution 2:  Low Bidders meeting Specifications – 

Miscellaneous Automotive Parts 
 
 
History 
• The Fleet Division is responsible for the maintenance of the City’s fleet; necessitating the 

purchase of auto parts which includes automobile, light truck, farm and construction equipment 
replacement parts. 

• The product lines are used daily to service, repair and maintain an exceedingly diverse fleet of 
over five hundred (500) pieces of City owned equipment.  

• These parts are ordered on an as needed basis and under the direction of the Fleet 
Operations Manager which enables the Fleet Division to acquire the proven dependable, high-
quality products needed to reduce downtime and labor costs, and improve vehicle availability 
and performance. 

• Additionally, the benefit of awarding primary and secondary vendors is the increased 
availability of parts at a guaranteed discounted rate. 

• The City’s previous Auto Parts Contract expired December 31, 2019.  That bid solicitation was 
conducted by the City and was very detailed and awarded low bid as specified by line item.   

• The current process was analyzed and evaluated.  Focusing on the efficiency of being able to 
purchase auto parts on a timely basis at the best possible price(s), it was recommended that 
the City utilize a cooperative contract which is available to all MITN members.  

• December 16, 2019 City Council approved a three (3) year contract with an option to renew for 
two (2) additional years to provide Auto Parts to Autowares Group of Companies, dba Maxi 
Auto Supply of Shelby Township., MI; as per the MITN Cooperative Purchasing RFP-RH-19-
039 unit pricing to be ordered on as needed basis; contract to expire July, 31, 2022; 
(Resolution 2019-12-166-J-4c). 
 
 
 
 


STANDARD PURCHASING RESOLUTION 2 – Low Bidders meeting Specifications – Miscellaneous Automotive Parts.  

RESOLVED, That Troy City Council hereby APPROVES a three (3) year contract with an option to renew for three (3) additional years to provide Miscellaneous Auto Parts to the companies listed below; as per detailed unit prices by line item as detailed in the bid tabulation and as per all bid specifications of ITB-COT 20-01 to be ordered on an as needed basis; not to exceed budgetary limitations; contract to expire June 30, 2023.



		 

		Proposal A

		Proposal B

		Proposal C



		Kirk's Automotive, Inc.

		x

		 

		[bookmark: _GoBack]x



		Cruiser's Inc.

		x

		 

		x



		A & L Systems

		x

		 

		x



		Amsoil dba Lubrication Spec.

		x

		 

		x



		Central Oil, LLC

		x

		x

		 



		Dealer Auto Parts Sales, Inc.

		 

		 

		x



		Palace CDJR (Milosch)

		 

		 

		x



		Suburban Ferndale Ford 

		 

		 

		x



		Suburban Troy (Chrysler/Dodge)

		 

		 

		x



		Suburban Motors Troy (GM)

		 

		 

		x
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History (continued) 
• Maxi Automotive Supply was chosen as the supplier because of their capacity to provide a vast

product offering and their extensive knowledge of auto/truck repair. They have nine (9)
warehouses and three hundred (300) stores to service the City.  The Shelby Township location
has 8 delivery vehicles running daily, and are able to deliver normal orders in less than one
hour, and emergency orders in less than 20 minutes.

• In addition to the Cooperative Contract being used the City of Troy Purchasing Department
issued a bid for the miscellaneous specialty auto parts not available on the MITN cooperative
contract.

Purchasing 
• On February 6, 2020 a bid opening was conducted as required by City Charter and Code to

furnish three (3) year requirements of miscellaneous auto replacement parts with an option to
renew for an additional three (3) years.

• The bid was posted on the Michigan Inter-governmental Trade Network (MITN) website;
www.mitn.info.

• Twelve (12) bid responses were received.  Below is a detailed summary of potential vendors:

Companies notified via MITN 205 
Troy Companies notified via MITN 5 
Troy Companies notified Active email 
Notification 5 
Troy Companies Active Free 0 
Companies that viewed the bid 30 
Troy Companies that viewed the bid 1 

• The attached Bid Tabulation was analyzed in conjunction with the Motor Pool Department.
• Miscellaneous Auto Parts are being recommended low bid as specified to be ordered on as

needed basis; not to exceed budgetary limitations as per the direction of the Motor Pool
Department.

• The Bid Tabulation details and highlights low bid line items.

Financial 
Funds are budgeted and available in the Equipment Operation & Maintenance Fund under the 
Fleet Department account number 661.549.550.7774.110. 

MITN provides a resourceful online platform to streamline the procurement 
process, reduce costs, and make it easier and more transparent for vendors 
to do business with the City of Troy. 
Active MITN members with a current membership and paying annual dues
receive automatic electronic notification which allows instant access to Bids, 
RFPS and Quote opportunities with the City.   
Active MITN non-paying members are responsible to monitor and check 
the MITN website for opportunities to do business with the City.
Inactive MITN member status can occur when a company does not renew 
their account upon expiration.  Inactive members cannot be notified of 
solicitations or access any bid information. 
 

http://www.mitn.info/
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Recommendation 
City management recommends awarding a three (3) year contract with an option to renew for three 
(3) additional years to provide Miscellaneous Auto Parts to the companies listed below; as per 
detailed unit prices by line item as detailed in the bid tabulation and as per all bid specifications of 
ITB-COT 20-01 to be ordered on an as needed basis; not to exceed budgetary limitations. 
 

  Proposal A Proposal B Proposal C 
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. x   x 
Cruiser's Inc. x   x 
A & L Systems x   x 
Amsoil dba Lubrication Spec. x   x 
Central Oil, LLC x x   
Dealer Auto Parts Sales, Inc.     x 
Palace CDJR (Milosch)     x 
Suburban Ferndale Ford      x 
Suburban Troy (Chrysler/Dodge)     x 
Suburban Motors Troy (GM)     x 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
G:\Bid Awards 19-20 Award Standard Purchasing Resolution 2 Misc Auto Parts 



Opening Date: 2/06/2020 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 20-01
Date Reviewed:  02/06/2020 BID TABULATION Page 1 of 12

AUTO PARTS

Vendor Name: Motown Auto Parts Kirk's Automotive, Inc Cruisers, Inc

City: Staunton, VA Detroit, MI Howell, MI

     PROPOSAL: 

Manufacturer Description Part # Price Price Price

Amsoil 55 Gallon Drum 5w30 oil No Bid $1,160.00 No Bid

Amsoil 55 Gallon Drum 15w40 DME No Bid $1,873.00 No Bid

Back Rack Back Rack Protector 15004 $165.00 No Bid No Bid

Back Rack Safety Rack 10900 $230.00 No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pre Wet System Wiring Harness 173630 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pre Wet System Wiring Harness R987376318 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth E-Series Coil R987371777 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pressure Sensor R987381387 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pre-Wet Lid Assembly R987377242 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Case Cutting Edge 18-B5290 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Code 3 Light Bar 21TRP147MC No Bid No Bid $1,475.00

Code 3 Light Siren Control CODE 3 Z3 No Bid No Bid $725.00

Go Rhino Push Bumper GR-5077T No Bid No Bid $254.60

Go Rhino Wrap Around GR-5077WT No Bid No Bid $217.70

Havis Radio Tray C-TTP-INUT-2 No Bid No Bid $225.45

Kennametal 60"x5"x7/8" Carbide Insert kennametal 
Scraper Blade PB-760H No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kennametal 48"x5"x7/8" Carbide Insert Kennametal 
Scraper Blade PB-748H No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kennametal 36"x5"x7/8" Carbide Insert Kennametal 
Scraper Blade CB15217 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monroe Snow Plow/ 
Spreader Parts Plow Leg 51202 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monroe Snow Plow/ 
Spreader Parts Gear Box 5007040 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Rotor 780256P $113.95 $95.75 No Bid

Raybestos Rotor 780395P $92.79 $75.53 No Bid

Raybestos Pads SP1057APPH $50.59 $47.60 No Bid

Raybestos Pads SP1611APPH $61.93 $58.24 No Bid

Raybestos Rotor 680982P $113.51 $84.84 No Bid

Root Snow Plow Shoe WP0664r2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Drum 16.5x7 SLV-36BD00AB $115.55 No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Shoe SLV-WK4707Q-23KSB No Bid No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Drum SLV-36BD87B $490.63 No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Shoe SLV-WK4715Q23KSB $92.66 No Bid No Bid

Soundoff Mini Lightbar epl7pdac $394.44 No Bid $245.00

Soundoff Siren Control sw830 No Bid No Bid $130.35

Schwarze 5 Segment Broom uu20750nyc $168.89 No Bid No Bid

Schwarze Switch 1546497C1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Troy Console CC-UV-L-18 No Bid No Bid $354.00

Tymco 4 Segment Broom SBP.200TNYC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vactor Debris Hose VA46564 No Bid No Bid No Bid

FURNISH THREE (3) YEAR REQUIREMENTS OF MISCELLANEOUS AUTO REPLACEMENT PARTS WITH AN OPTION TO RENEW FOR 
AN ADDITIONAL THREE (3) YEARS

PROPOSAL A:



Opening Date: 2/06/2020 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 20-01
Date Reviewed: BID TABULATION Page 2 of 12

AUTO PARTS

Vendor Name: Motown Auto Parts Kirk's Automotive, Inc Cruisers, Inc
City: Staunton, VA Detroit, MI Howell, MI

Manufacturer Description Part # Price Price Price

Wausau plow parts Actuating Lift Cylinder tt-2821s No Bid No Bid No Bid

Western plow parts Joystick Cab Control 56369 No Bid $405.00 No Bid

Western plow parts Plow Shoe 49071 No Bid $33.20 No Bid

Western plow parts Plow Shoe RT 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Specified 
Manufacturer

Wing Blade 84" Jr Wing Cutting Edge 
84"X8"X5/8" 4190164 No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Specified 
Manufacturer Wing Blade 108"X8"X5/8" 4166787 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Winter Equipment 
Company Curbguard Runner 3-3-3 Punch CR463U No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Price Price
$49.38 - 5 Gallon 

Container
$49.65 - 5 Gallon 

Container No Bid

$13.99 - 1 Gallon 
Container

$61.15 - 5 Gallon 
Container No Bid

% off List Price % off List Price % off List Price

No Bid 10% No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 35%

No Bid 10% No Bid

No Bid 15% No Bid

No Bid 15% No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 10% No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 45%

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 25%

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 10% No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Wausau plow parts

Western plow parts

Winter Equipment Company

     PROPOSAL A (Cont'd):

Soundoff

Schwarze

Troy

Tymco

Vactor

Kennametal 

Monroe Snow Plow/ Spreader Parts

Raybestos

Root

     PROPOSAL B:

General Motors

Go Rhino

Havis

Silverbacks

Description

Hydrualic Oil AW32 

Universal Tractor Oil 15W40


     PROPOSAL C:

Manufacturer

Amsoil

Back Rack

Bosch Rexroth

Case

Code 3

Fiat Chrysler Automobiles

Ford Motor Company

John Deere



Opening Date: 2/06/2020 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 20-01
Date Reviewed: BID TABULATION Page 3 of 12

AUTO PARTS

Vendor Name: Motown Auto Parts Kirk's Automotive, Inc Cruisers, Inc

City: Staunton, VA Detroit, MI Howell, MI

Extension of Award to MITN: Y or N Y Y N

Online ordering available - if yes, website address: Y or N

Y  
www.federatedlink.com/aces/in

dex.aspx
Y www.napaprolink.com Not Specified

F.O.B. minimum shipment amount: $0.00 $0.00 $25.00

References: Y or N Y Y Y

Contact Information:
Dave Elston, Regional 

Sales Mger Dan Wright Keith Wallaker

Hours of Operation:
M-F 8am-5:30pm  Sat 
8am-1pm  Sun closed 7:30am - 5:00pm 8:00am - 4:30pm M-F

24 Hr. Phone Number: (810) 241-8848 (734) 347-0304 (517) 206-8882

Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Warranty: Customer Satisfaction 90 Days Standard Mfer's

Acknowledgement: Y or N Y Y Y

Exceptions: Y or N N Y - Exception list 
provided N

Forms: Y or N Y Y Y



Opening Date: 2/06/2020 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 20-01
Date Reviewed:  02/06/2020 BID TABULATION Page 4 of 12

AUTO PARTS

Vendor Name: A&L Systems
Amsoil/dba Lubrication 
Specialists & Co LLC E Joist Distribution

City: Redford, MI Washington, MI Westland, MI

     PROPOSAL: 

Manufacturer Description Part # Price Price Price

Amsoil 55 Gallon Drum 5w30 oil No Bid $1,710.50 $429.00 exception:  
Supers brand

Amsoil 55 Gallon Drum 15w40 DME No Bid $1,523.50
$965.00 exception GAM 
2 brand & DME crossed 

out

Back Rack Back Rack Protector 15004 $156.00 No Bid No Bid

Back Rack Safety Rack 10900 $219.00 No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pre Wet System Wiring Harness 173630 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pre Wet System Wiring Harness R987376318 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth E-Series Coil R987371777 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pressure Sensor R987381387 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pre-Wet Lid Assembly R987377242 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Case Cutting Edge 18-B5290 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Code 3 Light Bar 21TRP147MC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Code 3 Light Siren Control CODE 3 Z3 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Go Rhino Push Bumper GR-5077T No Bid No Bid No Bid

Go Rhino Wrap Around GR-5077WT No Bid No Bid No Bid

Havis Radio Tray C-TTP-INUT-2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kennametal 60"x5"x7/8" Carbide Insert kennametal 
Scraper Blade PB-760H $349.99 No Bid No Bid

Kennametal 48"x5"x7/8" Carbide Insert Kennametal 
Scraper Blade PB-748H No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kennametal 36"x5"x7/8" Carbide Insert Kennametal 
Scraper Blade CB15217 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monroe Snow Plow/ 
Spreader Parts Plow Leg 51202 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monroe Snow Plow/ 
Spreader Parts Gear Box 5007040 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Rotor 780256P No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Rotor 780395P No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Pads SP1057APPH No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Pads SP1611APPH No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Rotor 680982P No Bid No Bid No Bid

Root Snow Plow Shoe WP0664r2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Drum 16.5x7 SLV-36BD00AB $83.75 No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Shoe SLV-WK4707Q-23KSB $46.99 No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Drum SLV-36BD87B $140.00 No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Shoe SLV-WK4715Q23KSB $53.01 No Bid No Bid

Soundoff Mini Lightbar epl7pdac $204.95 No Bid No Bid

Soundoff Siren Control sw830 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Schwarze 5 Segment Broom uu20750nyc No Bid No Bid No Bid

Schwarze Switch 1546497C1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Troy Console CC-UV-L-18 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tymco 4 Segment Broom SBP.200TNYC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vactor Debris Hose VA46564 No Bid No Bid No Bid

FURNISH THREE (3) YEAR REQUIREMENTS OF MISCELLANEOUS AUTO REPLACEMENT PARTS WITH AN OPTION TO RENEW FOR 
AN ADDITIONAL THREE (3) YEARS

PROPOSAL A:



Opening Date: 2/06/2020 CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 20-01
Date Reviewed: BID TABULATION Page 5 of 12

AUTO PARTS

Vendor Name: A&L Systems
Amsoil/dba Lubrication 
Specialists & Co LLC E Joist Distribution

City: Redford, MI Washington, MI Westland, MI

Manufacturer Description Part # Price Price Price
Wausau plow parts Actuating Lift Cylinder tt-2821s No Bid No Bid No Bid

Western plow parts Joystick Cab Control 56369 $320.00 No Bid No Bid

Western plow parts Plow Shoe 49071 $46.99 No Bid No Bid

Western plow parts Plow Shoe RT 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Specified 
Manufacturer

Wing Blade 84" Jr Wing Cutting Edge 
84"X8"X5/8" 4190164 No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Specified 
Manufacturer Wing Blade 108"X8"X5/8" 4166787 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Winter Equipment 
Company Curbguard Runner 3-3-3 Punch CR463U No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Price Price

No Bid $1,031.25 - 55 Gallon 
Drum $260.00

No Bid $1,053.25 - 55 Gallon 
Drum $395.00

% off List Price % off List Price % off List Price

No Bid 10% No Bid

25% No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

10% No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

25% No Bid No Bid

25% No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth

Manufacturer

Amsoil

Back Rack

Havis

John Deere

Kennametal 

Monroe Snow Plow/ Spreader Parts

Case

Code 3

Ford Motor Company

General Motors

Fiat Chrysler Automobiles

     PROPOSAL A (Cont'd):

     PROPOSAL B:
Description

Hydrualic Oil AW32 

Universal Tractor Oil 15W40


     PROPOSAL C:

Winter Equipment Company

Troy

Tymco

Vactor

Wausau plow parts

Western plow parts

Raybestos

Root

Silverbacks

Soundoff

Schwarze

Go Rhino
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AUTO PARTS

Vendor Name: A&L Systems
Amsoil/dba Lubrication 
Specialists & Co LLC E Joist Distribution

City: Redford, MI Washington, MI Westland, MI

Extension of Award to MITN: Y or N Y Y Y

Online ordering available - if yes, website address: Y or N
Y john@aandlsystems.com Y - amsoil.com

Y 
orders@ejoistdistribution.co

m

F.O.B. minimum shipment amount: $0.00 $350.00 $600.00

References: Y or N Y Y Y

Contact Information: Rob Amoe Michael Ellis Tony Caruso

Hours of Operation: Any 7am - 10pm 8am - 5pm M-F

24 Hr. Phone Number: (313) 910-2934 (586) 918-1578 Not Specified

Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Warranty: Manufacturers Not Specified Manufacturers

Acknowledgement: Y or N Y Y Y

Exceptions: Y or N Y N N

Forms: Y or N Y Y Y
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AUTO PARTS

Vendor Name: Central Oil LLC
Dealer Auto Parts 

Sales, Inc Palace CDJR (Milosch)

City: Roseville, MI Redford, MI Lake Orion, MI

     PROPOSAL: 

Manufacturer Description Part # Price Price Price

Amsoil 55 Gallon Drum 5w30 oil $360.00 exception:  
Supreme brand No Bid No Bid

Amsoil 55 Gallon Drum 15w40 DME $437.67 exception Fleet 
Ultra brand No Bid No Bid

Back Rack Back Rack Protector 15004 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Back Rack Safety Rack 10900 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pre Wet System Wiring Harness 173630 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pre Wet System Wiring Harness R987376318 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth E-Series Coil R987371777 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pressure Sensor R987381387 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pre-Wet Lid Assembly R987377242 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Case Cutting Edge 18-B5290 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Code 3 Light Bar 21TRP147MC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Code 3 Light Siren Control CODE 3 Z3 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Go Rhino Push Bumper GR-5077T No Bid No Bid No Bid

Go Rhino Wrap Around GR-5077WT No Bid No Bid No Bid

Havis Radio Tray C-TTP-INUT-2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kennametal 60"x5"x7/8" Carbide Insert kennametal 
Scraper Blade PB-760H No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kennametal 48"x5"x7/8" Carbide Insert Kennametal 
Scraper Blade PB-748H No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kennametal 36"x5"x7/8" Carbide Insert Kennametal 
Scraper Blade CB15217 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monroe Snow Plow/ 
Spreader Parts Plow Leg 51202 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monroe Snow Plow/ 
Spreader Parts Gear Box 5007040 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Rotor 780256P No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Rotor 780395P No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Pads SP1057APPH No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Pads SP1611APPH No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Rotor 680982P No Bid No Bid No Bid

Root Snow Plow Shoe WP0664r2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Drum 16.5x7 SLV-36BD00AB No Bid No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Shoe SLV-WK4707Q-23KSB No Bid No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Drum SLV-36BD87B No Bid No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Shoe SLV-WK4715Q23KSB No Bid No Bid No Bid

Soundoff Mini Lightbar epl7pdac No Bid No Bid No Bid

Soundoff Siren Control sw830 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Schwarze 5 Segment Broom uu20750nyc No Bid No Bid No Bid

Schwarze Switch 1546497C1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Troy Console CC-UV-L-18 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tymco 4 Segment Broom SBP.200TNYC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vactor Debris Hose VA46564 No Bid No Bid No Bid

FURNISH THREE (3) YEAR REQUIREMENTS OF MISCELLANEOUS AUTO REPLACEMENT PARTS WITH AN OPTION TO RENEW FOR 
AN ADDITIONAL THREE (3) YEARS

PROPOSAL A:
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AUTO PARTS

Vendor Name: Central Oil LLC
Dealer Auto Parts 

Sales, Inc Palace CDJR (Milosch)
City: Roseville, MI Redford, MI Lake Orion, MI

Manufacturer Description Part # Price Price Price
Wausau plow parts Actuating Lift Cylinder tt-2821s No Bid No Bid No Bid

Western plow parts Joystick Cab Control 56369 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Western plow parts Plow Shoe 49071 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Western plow parts Plow Shoe RT 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Specified 
Manufacturer

Wing Blade 84" Jr Wing Cutting Edge 
84"X8"X5/8" 4190164 No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Specified 
Manufacturer Wing Blade 108"X8"X5/8" 4166787 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Winter Equipment 
Company Curbguard Runner 3-3-3 Punch CR463U No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Price Price
$3.96/Gallon No Bid No Bid

$7.53/Gallon No Bid No Bid

% off List Price % off List Price % off List Price
No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 38%

No Bid 52% No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kennametal 

Monroe Snow Plow/ Spreader Parts

     PROPOSAL A (Cont'd):

     PROPOSAL B:
Description

Hydrualic Oil AW32 

Universal Tractor Oil 15W40


     PROPOSAL C:
Manufacturer

Amsoil

Back Rack

Bosch Rexroth

Case

John Deere

Winter Equipment Company

Troy

Tymco

Vactor

Wausau plow parts

Western plow parts

Raybestos

Silverbacks

Soundoff

Schwarze

Root

Havis

Code 3

Fiat Chrysler Automobiles

Ford Motor Company

General Motors

Go Rhino
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AUTO PARTS

Vendor Name: Central Oil LLC
Dealer Auto Parts 

Sales, Inc Palace CDJR (Milosch)
City: Roseville, MI Redford, MI Lake Orion, MI

Extension of Award to MITN: Y or N Y Y Y

Online ordering available - if yes, website address: Y or N N Y dealerautopartssales.com Y          repairlinkshop.com

F.O.B. minimum shipment amount: Not Specified $0.00 $0.00

References: Y or N Y Y Y 

Contact Information: Kaitlyn Wilson Rolf Debelacker John Waltereit

Hours of Operation: 7:30am-4:00pm M-F 8am-5pm M-F 7:30am-5:00pm M-F

24 Hr. Phone Number: (586) 445-2583 (313) 477-7684 (248) 497-0518

Payment Terms: 2% 10 days, Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Warranty: Not Specified 2 Year 2 Year unlimited miles

Acknowledgement: Y or N Y Y Y

Exceptions: Y or N Y N  Y

Forms: Y or N Y N Y
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AUTO PARTS

Vendor Name:
Suburban Ford of 

Ferndale, LLC
Suburban Troy, LLC 

(Chrysler Dodge)

Suburban Motors 
Company, LLC 

(Cadillac of Troy)
City: Ferndale, MI Troy, MI Troy, MI

     PROPOSAL: 

Manufacturer Description Part # Price Price Price
Amsoil 55 Gallon Drum 5w30 oil No Bid No Bid No Bid

Amsoil 55 Gallon Drum 15w40 DME No Bid No Bid No Bid

Back Rack Back Rack Protector 15004 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Back Rack Safety Rack 10900 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pre Wet System Wiring Harness 173630 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pre Wet System Wiring Harness R987376318 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth E-Series Coil R987371777 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pressure Sensor R987381387 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bosch Rexroth Pre-Wet Lid Assembly R987377242 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Case Cutting Edge 18-B5290 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Code 3 Light Bar 21TRP147MC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Code 3 Light Siren Control CODE 3 Z3 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Go Rhino Push Bumper GR-5077T No Bid No Bid No Bid

Go Rhino Wrap Around GR-5077WT No Bid No Bid No Bid

Havis Radio Tray C-TTP-INUT-2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kennametal 60"x5"x7/8" Carbide Insert Kennametal 
Scraper Blade PB-760H No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kennametal 48"x5"x7/8" Carbide Insert Kennametal 
Scraper Blade PB-748H No Bid No Bid No Bid

Kennametal 36"x5"x7/8" Carbide Insert Kennametal 
Scraper Blade CB15217 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monroe Snow Plow/ 
Spreader Parts Plow Leg 51202 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Monroe Snow Plow/ 
Spreader Parts Gear Box 5007040 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Rotor 780256P No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Rotor 780395P No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Pads SP1057APPH No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Pads SP1611APPH No Bid No Bid No Bid

Raybestos Rotor 680982P No Bid No Bid No Bid

Root Snow Plow Shoe WP0664r2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Drum 16.5x7 SLV-36BD00AB No Bid No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Shoe SLV-WK4707Q-23KSB No Bid No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Drum SLV-36BD87B No Bid No Bid No Bid

Silverbacks Brake Shoe SLV-WK4715Q23KSB No Bid No Bid No Bid

Soundoff Mini Lightbar epl7pdac No Bid No Bid No Bid

Soundoff Siren Control sw830 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Schwarze 5 Segment Broom uu20750nyc No Bid No Bid No Bid

Schwarze Switch 1546497C1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Troy Console CC-UV-L-18 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tymco 4 Segment Broom SBP.200TNYC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vactor Debris Hose VA46564 No Bid No Bid No Bid

FURNISH THREE (3) YEAR REQUIREMENTS OF MISCELLANEOUS AUTO REPLACEMENT PARTS WITH AN OPTION TO RENEW FOR 
AN ADDITIONAL THREE (3) YEARS

PROPOSAL A:
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AUTO PARTS

Vendor Name:
Suburban Ford of 

Ferndale, LLC
Suburban Troy, LLC 

(Chrysler Dodge)
Suburban, LLC           

(GM of Troy)
City: Ferndale, MI Troy, MI Troy, MI

Manufacturer Description Part # Price Price Price
Wausau plow parts Actuating Lift Cylinder tt-2821s No Bid No Bid No Bid

Western plow parts Joystick Cab Control 56369 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Western plow parts Plow Shoe 49071 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Western plow parts Plow Shoe RT 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Specified 
Manufacturer

Wing Blade 84" Jr Wing Cutting Edge 
84"X8"X5/8" 4190164 No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Specified 
Manufacturer Wing Blade 108"X8"X5/8" 4166787 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Winter Equipment 
Company Curbguard Runner 3-3-3 Punch CR463U No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Price Price
No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

% off List Price % off List Price % off List Price
No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid 25% No Bid

25% No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 25%

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Troy

Tymco

Vactor

Wausau plow parts

Raybestos

Root

Silverbacks

Soundoff

Schwarze

Havis

John Deere

Kennametal 

Monroe Snow Plow/ Spreader Parts

Case

Code 3

Fiat Chrysler Automobiles

Ford Motor Company

General Motors

Winter Equipment Company

Western plow parts

     PROPOSAL C:
Manufacturer

Amsoil

Back Rack

Bosch Rexroth

     PROPOSAL A (Cont'd):

     PROPOSAL B:
Description

Hydrualic Oil AW32 

Universal Tractor Oil 15W40


Go Rhino
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AUTO PARTS

Vendor Name:
Suburban Ford of 

Ferndale, LLC
Suburban Troy, LLC 

(Chrysler Dodge)

Suburban Motors 
Company, LLC 

(Cadillac of Troy)
City: Ferndale, MI Troy, MI Troy, MI

Extension of Award to MITN: Y or N Y Y Y

Online ordering available - if yes, website address: Y or N Not Specified Not Specified Not Specified

F.O.B. minimum shipment amount: Not Specified Not Specified Not Specified

References: Y or N Y Y Y 

Contact Information: Michael Spicko Scott Bradley Michael Penn

Hours of Operation:

Mon & Thurs 7am-7pm; 
Tues, Wed, Fri 7am-6pm; 

Sat 8am-3pm

Mon & Thurs 7am-8pm; 
Tues, Wed, Fri 7am-6pm; 

Sat 8am-3pm

Mon & Thurs 7am-8pm; 
Tues, Wed, Fri 7am-6pm; 

Sat 8am-3pm

24 Hr. Phone Number: (248) 399-1000 (248) 585-8800 (248) 643-0070

Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Warranty:

12 mo or 12K miles 
whichever comes 1st; Large 
assemblies may be as high 

as 3 yrs or 36K miles

12 mo or 12K miles 
whichever comes 1st; Large 
assemblies may be as high 

as 3 yrs or 36K miles

12 mo or 12K miles 
whichever comes 1st; Large 
assemblies may be as high 

as 3 yrs or 36K miles

Acknowledgement: Y or N Y Y Y 

Exceptions: Y or N N N N

Forms: Y or N Y Y Y 

ATTEST:
Brian Varney
Kelly LaPointe MaryBeth Murz, 
Susan Riesterer Purchasing Manager
Jackie Ahlstrom

Award low bid as specified.
Line Items - No award.
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