CITY COUNCIL MINUTES-Draft March 4, 2019

b) Standard Purchasing Resolution 2: Award to Low Bidder Meeting Specifications -
Gun Holsters and Lights — Police Department

Resolution #2019-03-025-J-4b

RESOLVED, That Troy City Council hereby AWARDS a contract to the low bidder meeting
specifications, Vance Outdoors, Inc. of Columbus, OH, to supply the Police Department with
Gun Holsters and Lights for an estimated total cost of $36,402.85 not to exceed budgetary
limitations at the unit prices as contained in the bid tabulation opened February 21, 2019; a
copy of which shall be ATTACHED to the original Minutes of this meeting.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, That the award is CONTINGENT upon contractor’s 'submission
of properly executed contract documents, including insurance certificates and all other specified

requirements.




PURCHASE ORDER

No. 2019-00001051
DATE: 03/11/2019

g CITY OF TROY W CITYOF TROY PAGE: 1 of 1

5 Police - Police FOB DESTINATION

-4 500 W BIG BEAVER RD o 500 W BIG BEAVER RD

o TROY, Ml 48084 TROY, Ml 48084
COUNCIL RESOLUTION
2019-03-J-4b

VENDOR NO. 139789 INSTRUCTIONS

Return to Department

g VANCE OUTDOORS, INC

35  DBAVANCE LAW ENFORCEMENT

g— 3723 CLEVELAND AVE

S COLUMBUS, OH 43224

m UNIT DESCRIPTION UNIT cosT] TOTAL cosT
100.5500 $9,853.90

98 | Each RH Holster Model 7360-832-481
11| Each LH Holster Mode!l 7360-832-482 100.5500 $1,106.05
11 | Each RH Holster Model 7360-832-411 100.5500 $1,106.05
1| Each LH Holster Model 7360-832-412 100.5500 $100.55
121 | Each Surefire x300U-A HandgunLight 200.3000 $24,236.30
Entered By: MaryBeth Murz $36,402.85
Special Instructions:
CITY COUNCIL AWARD DATE: 2/26/2019. Deliver as per all bid specifications of ITB-COT 19-05.

TERMS & CONDITIONS
1. Purchases of Municipalities are exempt from State Sales and Federal Excise Taxes.

2. Prior to acceptance, vendor agrees to provide City with information under the Right-to-Know Law, P.A. 1986, No. 80, and fully

comply with all terms and conditions of the

Michigan Occupational Safety and Health Act, MCL 408.1001, et seq. including

vendor shall provide City with an “MSDS". Vendor also agrees to be responsible for all required labeling.
3. In cases of emergency/disaster, the City can purchase up to six(6) times the order amount for a period of six(6) months at the

price contained in the contract.

4. Purchase Orders are sighed electronically based upon computer generated “on-line” authorized approvals. Authentic

signatures are on file in the City of Troy Purchasing Department.

NOTICE: The City could put the vendor on notice that vendors will be held financially responsible for any claims or awards made

against the City as a result of the vendor's action. If the City has to defend the initial lawsuit, the City will
defendant or sue the vendor, either as the result of settling a claim or the conclusion of the lawsuit.

bring in the vendor as a co-

| HEREBY GERTIFY THAT THIS ORDER IS PROPERLY AUTHORIZED AND APPROVED. /MWW 2

Q




Opening Date: 2/21/2019
Reviewed Date: 2/21/2019

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION

Vendor Name:
CITY:

GUN HOLSTERS & LIGHTS

Botach inc.

Vance Outdoors, Inc.

ITB-COT 19-05

Page 1 of 2

Acme Sports, Inc.

Las Vegas, NV

Columbus, OH

Seymour, IN

PROPOSAL: FURNISH GUN HOLSTERS AND LIGHTS FOR THE CITY OF TROY POL

ICE DEPARTMENT.

Est.
QTY

Description

Unit Cost | Total Cost

Unit Cost | Total Cost

Unit Cost | Total Cost

98

Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level {ll Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-481

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 6

Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

Finish: Basket Weve

$102.17 | $10,012.66

$100.55 | $9,853.90

$109.00 |$10,682.00

11

Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level 1l Retention Duty Holster

Part; 7360-832-482

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen &

Barrel Length; 4.5" Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

Finish: Basket Weve

$102.17 $1,123.87

$100.55 | $1,106.05

$109.00 $1,199.00

11

Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level Il Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-411

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen &

Barrel Length: 4.5”" Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

Finish: Plain

$102.17 $1,123.87

$100.55 | $1,106.05

$109.00 $1,199.00

Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level !l Retention Duty Holster

Part; 7360-832-412

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5 Barrel Length: 4.5”

Caliber: 9mmColor Light: Surefire x300u

Color: Black Material: Safari seven

Finish: Plain

$102.17 $102.17

$100.55 $100.55

$109.00 $109.00

121

Surefire x300U-A
1,000 Lumens Led Handgun Light with T-Slot
Mounting Rail

$187.59 | $22,698.39

$200.30 | $24,236.30

$197.30 | $23,873.30

Grand Totai:

$35,060.96

$36,402.85

$37,062.30

Lead Time

Warranty
Insurance Met:

YorN
YorN
YorN

Exceptions:

Acknowledgement:
Forms:
References:

YorN
YorN
YorN

30-60 Days

30-60 Days

4-6 Weeks

N

Y

Y

Y

Y

Y

Will hold Safariland price
till 3/31/2020. Wilf hold
Surefire prices till
12/31/2019.

Y

Y

<|=<i=<

Y

~<|=<|=<




Opening Date: 2/21/2019
Reviewed Date: 2/21/2019

Vendor Name:
CITY:

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION
GUN HOLSTERS & LIGHTS

CMP Distributors, Inc.

Kiesler Police Supply, Inc.

ITB-COT 19-05
Page 2 of 2

Dinges Fire Co.

Lansing, Ml

Jeffersonville, IN

Pinckney, Ml

PROPOSAL: FURNISH GUN HOLSTERS AND LIGHTS FOR THE CITY OF TROY POL

CE DEPARTMENT.

==

Description

Unit Cost | Total Cost

Unit Cost | Total Cost

Unit Cost | Total Cost

Fo%e V4

98

Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level Il Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-481

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen &

Barrel Length: 4.5" Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material; Safariseven

Finish: Basket Weve

$119.30 | $11,691.40

No bid

11

Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level 11l Retention Duty Holster

Part; 7360-832-482

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5

Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

$119.30 $1,312.30

No bid

11

Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level Il Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-411

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5

Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

Finish; Plain

$119.30 $1,312.30

No bid

Left Handed Safariland Mode! 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level lll Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-412

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5 Barrel Length: 4.5

Caliber: 9mmColor Light: Surefire x300u

Color: Black Material: Safari seven

Finish: Plain

$119.30 $119.30

No bid

121

Surefire x300U-A
1,000 Lumens Led Handgun Light with T-Slot
Mounting Rail

$216.55 | $26,202.55

201.48 | $24,379.08

Grand Total:

$40,637.85

$24,379.08

Lead Time

Warranty
Insurance Met:
Exceptions:
Acknowledgement:
Forms:
References:

YorN
Y orN
YorN
YorN
YorN
YorN

Late Bid Was Submitted

ATTEST:

Sue Reisterer
Kristine Kallek
Larysa Figol

30-45 Days

30 Days

<< =< Z]| <<

< <|<|z|<l=<

LATE BID

MaryBeth Murz,
Purchasing Manager




MIGHIGAN

CITY OF TROY ITB-COT 19-05
BID PROPOSAL Page 10of 6

The undersigned proposes to furnish GUN HOLSTERS AND LIGHTS, in accordance with the bid specifications
attached hereto, which are \tj be considered an integral part of this proposal, at the following prices:

COMPANY NAME: OnCe O U"h} pors, ULC <
: FURNISH GUN HOLSTERS AND LIGHTS

Description Unit Cost | Estimated
(Each) |Total Cost

98 Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA Mid-

Ride Level lll Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-481 ; :

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5 fh1080 55 |82 355,00

Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

Finish: Basket Weve

Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA Mid-Ride

1 Level lll Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-482 '

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5 B o 55

Barrel Length: 4.5" Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

Finish: Basket Weve

11 Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA Mid-

Ride Level Il Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-411 ' i 54

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5 & \(ge 5

Barrel Length: 4.5" Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

Finish: Plain

1 Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA Mid-Ride

Level Ill Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-412 ; LA KV

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5 Barrel Length: 4.5” 6100 52| 100,55

Caliber: 9mm Light: Surefire x300u

Color: Black Material: Safari seven

Finish: Plain

121 Surefire x300U-A

1,000 Lumens Led Handgun Light with T-Slot Mounting Ralil &QQ}{};‘Q %Z’})(}k’j’)(g 30
&

B106,05

=

<z
J

B, Lot

The undersigned, as bidder, declares that he/she has examined the specifications, including related documents.

New Gun Holsters & Lights in accordance with the attached bid specifications. NO_SUBSTITUTES OR
ALTERNATES WILL BE ACCEPTED.
NOTE: Include all delivery costs, handling and packaging in the unit cost (each) price.




Bid Proposal
Gun Holsters & Lights
Page 2 of 6

UNIT PRICES:
Unit prices prevail. The City of Troy Purchasing Department will correct all mathematical errors.

ESTIMATED QUANTITIES:

Quantities stated are estimated and not guaranteed, but will be used for award purposes. The City of Troy will not
be penalized for ordering more or less than the stated quantities. It is the intent to purchase the minimum quantities
stated or more. Estimated quantities do not include potential new hires. It is the intent of the Police Department to
make an initial purchase of each item listed at different quantities. There will be a need to order ongoing quantity's
which will vary of each item per year.

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:
For questions about the specifications, please contact Daniel Galich at (248) 524-3531 between the hours of 8:00
AM and 4:00 PM, Monday through Friday.

CONTRACT FORMS:

Bidders should complete the Legal Status of Bidder, Non-Collusion Affidavit, Certification regarding
Debarment, the Certification regarding “Iran Linked Business” and the Familial Disclosure Forms and return
with your bid proposal.

DELIVERY:
All items will be FOB delivered inside, freight paid to the Troy Palice Department, 500 W. Big Beaver Rd., Troy, Ml
48084, Attn: Daniel Galich

DOWN-PAYMENTS OR PREPAYMENTS:
Any bid proposal submitted which requires a down-payment or prepayment prior to delivery and full acceptance of
the item(s) as being in conformance with specifications will not be considered for award.

LEAD TIME: B N
Please state Lead Time: x50 tv G b‘/»‘{? AR@

WARRANTY: - NI V2 IAVEN TP \QA
Please state Warranty: SWW“W‘% bvmmh{ &»Ym@\\iu )@'re}zg\i Was !”M\;Lf &,tﬁmii
‘ (

AWARD:
The evaluation and award of this bid shall be a combination of factors, including but not limited to: cost, professional
competence, warranties, and the correlation of the proposal submitted to the needs of the City of Troy.

The City of Troy reserves the right to award this bid to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications to reject
low bids which have major deviations from the specifications; to accept a higher bid which has only minor deviations,
in whatever manner is deemed to be in the City of Troy’s best interest.

LOCAL PREFERENCE:

The City of Troy reserves the right to award a contract to a local business, one which pays City of Troy taxes
(real and/or personal), if the bid of a local vendor is within 5% of the lowest responsive and responsible non-local
bidder, then the local vendor is given one chance to match the low bid.

DOWN PAYMENTS AND PREPAYMENTS:
Any proposal submitted which requires a down payment or prepayment of any kind prior to delivery and acceptance
of the items as being in conformance with specifications will not be considered for award.

COMPANY NAME: \\[ oL O Uﬁ?\[\ﬁﬁ 17, ‘J\C ¢




Bid Proposal
Gun Holsters & Lights
Page 3 of 6

ALTERNATES:
No substitutes or alternates will be accepted.

DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:
Please attach descriptive or pertinent literature specification or cut sheet(s) relevant to your company’s bid proposal
at the time of bid submission. It is attached and marked 9?&1&5?@& for identification.

PURCHASE ORDER:

After approval of the successful bidder by the Troy City Council, the purchase order issued from the City of Troy
will create a bilateral contract between the parties and commit the successful bidder to perform the contract in
accordance with specifications. A contract document/ agreement will not be issued.

CONTACT INFORMATION:

Name(s). \% wo o 24 Hr. Phone No._ (¢ (4 -2X7-7390
Email {} yoneg € i/auf\ézafﬁ‘aﬁ’ﬁ@ (1 Phone No. 9f\ﬂ&@t 7 &xiﬁﬁv@
Hours of operation: ,;N\()Q qc{’g,}”’/Lﬁ/@“)%’; Yo~ COEP

REFERENCES

Please list at least three (3) Police departments that have had similar work completed by your company.

COMPANY:_Q%iy Jfat? oy Peckro) i
ADDRESS: _ 150 E, (] Afe , (hlunbpvs O 5L

CONTACT: [ THldertorandt PHONE: [, (4 337-GI1A
EMAIL: blalderbrond+e.4P5. hin .Qou

. . i < P )
compANy: Frontdi n (ounby Shor 15 0 Fhe
ADDRESS: (3515 Nt RI— @rveGiy 00 NSRS
CONTACT: ite KpWsal/ PHONE: (314-525-450%
EMAIL: _ou Kalzso @ FranklenCountijoWea 4ol |

v ; 1
COMPANY: University of Michiaon

ADDRESS: 1257 Yapide b A Mboor T B35S ]
CONTACT: Gabs Moitin-Lopners . PHONE: 15413~ (333
EMAIL: ”)fr;f/\ﬁ’@}*%é Jraich-edy

i i i
COMPANY NAME: U ﬁ\f\iflmaﬁé W‘ﬁi/ l AC,




Bid Proposal
Gun Holsters & Lights
Page 4 of 6

Insurance requirements shall be in accordance with the attached SAMPLE INSURANCE
CERTIFICATE and ENDORSEMENT. The required Insurance Certificate and Endorsement must be
submitted to the city within 5 days of the verbal/ electronic request after the bid award. The Insurance
Certificate and Endorsement may be faxed to the Purchasing Office at (248) 619-7608, and is the only
bid document accepted in this format.

The contractor, or any of their subcontractors, shall not commence work under this contract until they
have obtained the insurance required, and shall keep such insurance in force during the entire life of
this contract. All coverage shall be with insurance companies licensed and admitted to business in the
State of Michigan and acceptable to the City of Troy. The requirements below should not be interpreted
to limit the liability of the Contractor. All deductibles and self-insured retentions (SIR’s) are the
responsibility of the Contractor.

(X) We can meet the specified insurance requirements.

( ) We cannot meet the specified insurance

requirements.

( ) We do not carry the specified limits but can obtain the additional insurance coverage of
, at the cost of § .

NOTE: Please note the amendments on a sample insurance certificate and attach it

to your bid proposal.

( ) Our proposal is reduced by $ if we lower the requirement to

NOTE: Please note the amendments on a sample insurance certificate and attach it to your
bid proposal.

IMPORTANT: A Certificate of Insurance on an ACORD Form showing present coverage as well as the
required endorsements SHALL be attached to the proposal document at the time of submission of the
proposal to the Office of the City Clerk. '

NOTE: Failure on the part of any bidder to contact his/her insurance carrier to verify that the insurance
carried by the bidder meets City of Troy specifications may result in this proposal being completed
incorrectly.

OTHER: Sole proprietors must execute a certificate of exemption from Worker’s Compensation
requirements or provide proof of Worker's Compensation Insurance. All coverage shall be with
insurance carriers licensed and admitted to do business in Michigan in accordance with all applicable
statutes of the State of Michigan and acceptable to the City of Troy.

INSURANCE VERIFICATION:
A bidder shall complete the above portion, which details additional costs that may be incurred for
specified coverage without purchasing the additional coverage prior to bid submission.

WORKERS’' COMPENSATION INSURANGE, including Employers’ Liability Coverage, in accordance
with all applicable statutes of the State of Michigan.

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE on an “Occurrence Basis” with limits of liability not

Jless than $1,000.000.00 per occurrence and aggregate. Coverage shall include the following

extensions: (A) Contractual liability; (B) Products and Completed Operations; (C) Independent

Contractors Coverage; (D) Broad Form General Liability Extensions or equivalent, if not already

included; (E) Deletion of all Explosion, C:gapse, and Underground (XCU) Exclusions, if applicable.
A i

COMPANY NAME: \] N LY O ALY

k2




Bid Proposal
Gun Holsters & Lights
Page 5 of 6

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY, including Michigan No-Fault Coverages, with limits of liability not less than
$1,000,000.00 per occurrence combined single limit for Bodily Injury, and Property Damage. Coverage
shall include all owned vehicles, all non-owned vehicles, and all hired vehicles.

ADDITIONAL INSURED:

Commercial General Liability and Automobile Liability, as described in the attached SAMPLE shall
include an Additional Insured Endorsement stating the following shall be Additional Insureds: The
City of Troy including all elected and appointed officials, all employees and volunteers, all boards,
commissions, and/or authotities and council members, including employees and volunteers thereof. It
is understood and agreed by naming the City of Troy as additional insured, coverage afforded is
considered to be primary and any other insurance the City of Troy may have in effect shall be
considered secondary and/or excess.

CANCELLATION NOTICE:

All policies, as described above, shall include an endorsement stating that it is understood and agreed
that Thirty (30) days, Ten (10) days for non-payment of premium, Advance Written Notice of
Cancellation, Non-Renewal, Reduction, and/or Material Change shall be mailed to;

City of Troy
Purchasing Manager
500 West Big Beaver
Troy, Ml 48084

PROOF OF INSURANCE COVERAGE:

The Contractor shall provide the City of Troy, at the time that the contracts are returned by him/her for
execution, a Certificate of Insurance as well as the required endorsements. In lieu of required
endorsements, if applicable, a copy of the policy sections where coverage is provided for additional
insured and cancellation notice would be acceptable. Copies or certified copies of all policies
mentioned above all shall be furnished, if so requested.

If any of the applicable coverages expire during the term of this contract, the Contractor shall deliver
renewal certificates and endorsements to the City of Troy at least ten (10) days prior to the expiration
date.

LETTER VERIFICATION:

The recommended bidder will be notified to submit a letter from the insurance agent or carrier that the
insurance to be supplied will meet specifications. As an alternative, the recommended bidder may
submit the certificate of insurance meeting specifications at this time at his/her option. The City must
receive this letter or certificate within 5 business days after verbal / electronic notification has
been delivered to the recommended bidder or the bidder will be considered non-responsive and
the bid un-awardable. This process will occur before presentation of the award recommendation to the
Troy City Council.

FINAL INSURANCE CERTIFICATE SUBMISSION:

After approval by Troy City Council, the City’s Purchasing Manager will review the insurance certificates
and endorsements to ensure all acceptable documents have been received and allow (5) business
additional days after verbal / electronic notification to submit final insurance certificate(s) in accordance
with specifications. The City of Troy reserves the right to WITHHOLD AND KEEP any bid surety for
failure to comply. The company will be considered in default of contract and will be barred from doing
business with the City of Troy for a minimum of three (3) years for failing to meet insurance
requirements.

COMPANY NAME: \) NG O’Usﬁ%%‘ R}&N;




Bid Proposal
Gun Holsters & Lights
Page 6 of 6

SIGNATURE PAGE
PRICES:

Prices shall remain firm for 60 days or bid award, whichever comes first, except the successful bidder whose
prices shall remain firm for the entire contract period which shall commence on the date of award.

4 ! b/
SIGNATURE DF AUTHORIZED COMPANY REFRESENTATIVE: /{ 1%  Vodge—

NOTE:
The undersigned has checked carefully the bid figures and understands that he/she shall be responsible for
any error or omission in this bid offer and is in receipt of all addenda as issued.

Taxios 2920720758

COMPANY NAME: \)O\f\k_ﬁ, G{/\L@%w@/ U\éﬁ
appress 3125 Cleve Mﬁc} Ave, cry Colynbovs  state 0 zip NI
pHoNE NumBer (o 1R = HT1- 7008 «(5  Fax NUMBER G H-H71-3. (34
REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME__D7V3, Vance |
SIENATURE OF ALTHORIZED COMPANY —— | o

. {
PAYMENT TERMS: A eE30 %x‘{ﬁ WAéF/%ANTY: ATTACH DETAILED WARRANTY INFO
E-MAIL: bi)oi\w @ yony efu"t"clw,lx «C0M  DELIVERY DATE: 2~ >0 (0 b”\{/ 5 ARD

EXCEPTIONS:

Any exceptions, substitutions, deviations, etc., from the City specifications and this proposal must be stated
below. The reason(s) for the exceptions, substitutions, and/or deviations are an integral part of this bid proposal
offer:. - N e o V\é X . ‘, é’} . ' /

% Vancy Oubdors il g SeFatond prices Firm For onders recaived thiougih 3134/20:
¥ Vo Outdgrs will hold SureHre piices Frrm Tor prjus ecedid #hmi;&)f'&; R[2 A

D Check this box if your bid is not to be broken up by item and based on an all or none award.

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:

I, unaVenld , certify that | have read the Instructions to Bidders (2 Pages) and that
the bid prop’osal documents contained herein were obtained directly from the City's Purchasing Department or
MITN website, www.mitn.info and is an official copy of the Aythorized Version.

SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE: (m’%” (// e —

NOTE: The City of Troy, at their discretion, maé requié the bidder to supply a Financial Report from an impartial
Financial Credit Reporting Service before award of contract at no cost to the City.

IMPORTANT: Al City of Troy purchases require a SAFETY DATA SHEET, where applicable, in compliance
with the MIOSHA "Right to Know" Law. Please include a copy of any relevant SDS at the time of bid submission.

U.S. CURRENCY: All figures quoted are to be in U.S. Funds.




Legal Status of Bidder:

The Bidder shall fill out the appropriate form and strike out the other
two:

A corporatign duly grganized and doing business under the laws of the State of _,, C}'V\%Q

3

for whom ARV , bearing the office title of Viee Yresagenf
whose signature i§ affixed to this proposal, is duly authorized to execute contracts.

rtnership, all members of which, with addresses, is:

AN INDIVIDUAL, WHOSE SIGN: XED TO THE PROPOSAL:




MICHIGAN

CiTY OF TROY
OAKLAND COUNTY, MICHIGAN

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN:
bé’i/@:\ Vaﬂcé, . being duly sworn deposed, says that he/she
(Print FulfName) j
Vi v P NG g,@f')'/ . The party making the foregoing proposal or bid,

(State Official Capacity in Firm)

that such bid is genuine and not collusion or sham; that said bidder has not colluded,
conspired, connived, or agree, directly or indirectly, with any bidder or person, to put
in a sham bid or to refrain from bidding and has not in any manner directly or
indirectly sought by agreement or collusion, or communication or conference, with
any person to fix the bid price or affiant or any other bidder, or to fix any overhead,
profit, or cost element of said bid price, or that of any other bidder, or to secure the
advantage against the City of Troy or any person interested in the proposed
contract: and that all statements contained in said proposal or bid are true.

[ 7@/(//&/{ V [T “"Maﬂm (717'1%7{95/!? !/‘((’; - V;%;z f?wfa’w

SIGNATURZOF PERSON SUBMITTING BID

Yy

NOTARY'S SIGNATURE

Subscribed and sworn to before me this £ ’VSZ 2 b (— day of
[ Prvhty , 2018 in and for \.u"",‘U'B'L"u.,
_FenrnIips, (¥ County. [ \s“$§fﬁ¥....fc”“ z;,"v,

. . - 2ot/
My commission expires: o« <




CERTIFICATION REGARDING
DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION, AND OTHER RESPONSIBILITY MATTERS

The prospective participant certifies, to the best of its knowledge and belief, that it and its principals:

1. Are not presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily
excluded from participation in transactions under any non-procurement programs by any federal,
state or local agency.

2. Have not, within the three year period preceding, had one or more public transactions (federal, state,
or local) terminated for cause or default; and

3. Are not presently indicted or otherwise criminally or civilly charged by a government entity (federal,
state, or local) and have not, within the three year period preceding the proposal, been convicted of
or had a civil judgment rendered against it:

a. For the commission of fraud or a criminal offense in connection with obtaining, attempting to
obtain, or performing a public transaction (federal, state, or local), or a procurement contract

under such a public transaction;

b. For the violation of federal, or state antitrust statutes, including those proscribing price fixing
between competitors, the allocation of customers between competitors, or bid rigging; or

c. For the commission of embezzlement, theft, forgery, bribery, falsification or destruction of records,
making false statements, or receiving stolen property.

| understand that a false statement on this certification may be grounds for the rejection of this proposal or
the termination of the award. In addition, the general grant of this authority exists within the City’s Charter,
hapter 12, Section 12.2- Contracts.
| am able to certify to the above statements.

AT o
\ang Oute Jd&i‘z e,
Name of Agency/Company/Firrh (Please Print)

sus Voneg ~\ieo Tresiamnt
Name and title of authorized representative (Please Print)

| ounafir e 2 )18l

Signdture of Authorized representative
ate

[ ] 1am unable to certify to the above statements. Attached is my explanation.
G:\Purchasing Forms - Instructions\Certification regarding debarment (2).doc




VENDOR CERTIFICATION
THAT ITIS NOT AN
“IRAN LINKED BUSINESS”

Pursuant to Michigan law, (the Iran Economic Sanctions Act, 2012 PA 517, MCL 129.311 et seq.), before
accepting any bid or proposal, or entering into any contract for goods or services with any prospective
Vendor, the Vendor must first certify that it is not an “lRAN LINKED BUSINESS’, as defined by law.

Vendor
Legal Name \,[ ONCL C’Uﬁ)ﬂé"f(@ (/1(?’.
Street Address ’9’7313 Cl&\fé\ﬁi/\(‘”) A\Nh
City CO\UM bus
State, Zip O i‘s( %3?31‘{
Corporate |.D. Number/State \’5%9?)0 L& /@t\
Taxpayer |.D. # 6“&'9\07 303%

The undersigned, with: 1.)full knowledge of all of Vendors business activities, 2.)full knowledge of the
requirements and possible penalties under the law MCL 129.311 et seq. and 3.) the full and complete
authority to make this certification on behalf of the Vendor, by his/her signature below, certifies that: the
Vendor is NOT an “IRAN LINKED BUSINESS" as require by MCL 129.311 et seq., and as such that Vendor
is legally eligible to submit a bid and be considered for a possible contract to supply goods and/or services to
the City of Troy.

Signature of Vendor’'s Authorized Agent: (/ Z&W )

Printed Name of Vendor's Authorized Agent: bC’VQ (/mﬂ&

’
Witness Signature: % /%'M
= I/

777

IO
Printed Name of Witness: - \%’VJ}\J "

G:\ BidLanguage_lIranLinkedBusiness




MICHIGAN

Proposer’s Sworn and Notarized Familial Disclosure

(to be provided by the Proposer)

)
The undersigned, the owner or authorized officer of Yj N C/{/ 'f’jgjﬁﬁﬁ,, [ﬁé‘ (the
“Proposer”), pursuant to the familial disclosure requirement provided in thé Request for
Proposal, hereby represent and warrant, except as provided below, that no familial |
relationships exist between the owner(s) or any employees of _ Vo ed §u 7‘0(05’/"?’. lnc,

and any member of the City of Troy City

Council or City of Troy management.

List any Familial Relationships:

N2NE

STATE OEMHEHIGAN O W D

COUNTY OF %\él—}v\)

BIDDER: \
onte Jydoors, e

/AR
Its: (/;‘Cé//%}fzy@ﬁ

)ss.

)

This instrument was acknowledged before me on the /& :///(?ay of Féﬁrzf/*w/2019, by

Dovales A Vawes

s
A\ puBL
K 0‘0\?‘\{ IC‘NO. "0‘;"

i AN e




Model 7360:
Mid-ride

M SFCURE AND DURABLE

7360 7TS™ ALS®/SLS
LEVEL Ill RETENTION™ HOLSTER®

7362/7365 7TS™ ALS®/SLS HI-RIDE AND LOW-RIDE
LEVEL 11l RETENTION HOLSTER

The Safariland® 7360/7362/7365 7TS™ Level lll Retention™ duty holsters
feature precision injection-molding, making them extremely lightweight
and durable. Constructed from SafariSeven™, a proprietary DuPont™ nylon
blend, the 7TS series holsters are non-abrasive to the weapon's finish,
and nearly impervious to the elements, with very high tolerance to heat
and cold.

These models use the ALS® (Automatic Lacking System), and the SLS
(Self Locking System) rotating hood closure, to achieve Leve! |1l Retention™.
The holster’s interior has raised surfaces that create airspace around the
weapon, allowing dirt and moisture to quickly clear any contact. The
holsters are compatible with all Safariland® holster mounting options.
The 7365 low-ride option allows the holster to drop 1.5" {38mm) below
the waist, and the 7362 hi-ride, raises the holster 1.5” above the mid-ride.

PATENTED and PATENT PENDING

Madel 7362: Hi-ride Model 7365: Low-ride

FEATURES -
n ALS‘E‘ (Automatic Looklng System) Secures weapan.onge holstered
'1 and offers a snmp[e stralght-up draw once release is deactivated

SLS (Self Locking System) rotating hood closure provades pr otectlon
and allows fora smoother single motion draw: E )

n Crafted with SafanSeven a proprietary DuPont nylon blend that is
- completely non- abrastve toa ttrearm s finish ~ ,

* Matte ttmsh desngned t0 decreasereﬂectton and can be mamtamed
wnh a snmple scounng pad - =

mountlng ODUODS

= Ra|sed stand—otf surfaces inthe mtenor of the holster create air space
around the weapon allowmg dirt and mOtsture to quxckly clear any
contaot with the ﬁrearm - ,

- 0%

- ,‘ Very hlgh gh heat and cold tolerances struotural!y sound from -50°F o

SAFARILAND.COM/SAFARILAND

012517-TRB | ©2017 Ssfariland, LLG

mishe’Si

= Avadable in SafanSeven Black and FDE Brown

, * Level lVRetent/an is echleved w:th the optlonal Sentry mstalled
See our Ha/ster Fit Gu:de at Safanland com - - = =

Visit http //wwwsafanland com/holsters and-gear resources/holster—reten- .
tmn levels html furmformatwn an Safanlands retentlon Ievels -

SAFARILAND.
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EXPRESS LIMITED WARRANTY FOR
HOLSTER AND ACCESSORY PRODUCTS

Safariland (the “Company”) warrants its Safariland® brand holster products to be free
from defects in materials and workmanship for a period of two (2) years from date of purchase.
This warranty is subject to the proper Care and Maintenance of the product and proper use of
the product as detailed in the Consumer and Safety Information.

If you believe this product has any defects in materials or workmanship, cease use
immediately and contact customer service for a remedy. If a product proves to be defective in
material or workmanship, we will repair or replace the product and send it to you at the
Company’s expense. All returns must include the proof of purchase and documentation
specifying the claimed defect.

This is a LIMITED WARRANTY, and is the sole and exclusive warranty of this product
by the Company. It shall not be enlarged by any representations, descriptions, course of
dealing, trade usage, rendering of technical advice, service or otherwise. Furthermore, it shall
not be altered or expanded by any acts, statements, or agreements of any dealer, employee or
agent of the Company (other than by a duly authorized officer of the Company).

THE COMPANY MAKES NO OTHER WARRANTIES EXPRESS, IMPLIED, OR
STATUTORY, INCLUDING WITHOUT LIMITATION ANY IMPLIED WARRANTY OF FITNESS
FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE OR MERCHANTABILITY.

IN NO EVENT SHALL THE COMPANY BE LIABLE FOR ANY PUNITIVE,
EXEMPLARY, OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES, ANTICIPATED OR LOST PROFITS,
INCIDENTAL DAMAGES, LOSS OF TIME, OR OTHER INDIRECT LOSSES OR EXPENSES
THAT ARISE FROM ANY CAUSE RELATING TO THE PRODUCT, REGARDLESS OF THE
FORM OF THE ACTION, WHETHER IN TORT (INCLUDING NEGLIGENCE), CONTRACT,
STRICT LIABILITY OR OTHERWISE, AND REGARDLESS OF WHETHER THE COMPANY
HAS BEEN ADVISED OF THE POSSIBILITY OF SUCH CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES.
SOME STATES DO NOT ALLOW THE EXCLUSION OR LIMITATION OF INCIDENTAL OR
CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES, SO THE ABOVE LIMITATION OR EXCLUSION MAY NOT
APPLY TO YOU. THIS WARRANTY GIVES YOU SPECIFIC LEGAL RIGHTS, AND YOU MAY
ALSO HAVE OTHER RIGHTS WHICH VARY FROM STATE TO STATE.

For any warranty issue, please contact customer care for a prompt resolution to your
concern at the number provided below.

Safariland, LLC

3120 E. Mission Blvd.
Ontario, CA 91761

Customer Care: 800-347-1200 (USA Only) or 909-923-7300

3120 E. Mission Blvd. « Ontario « CA + 91761 909-923-7300 » www.safariland.com
Rev 10.8.11
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X300U-A

1,000 Lumens LED Handgun Light with Rail-Lock® Mounting System

Specifications
Bezel Diameter " 1.125” | mches
Length 3.60 inches
Weight w/Batteries 4.0 ounces
Batteries : 2 123A (included)
Outpuf White 1,000 Lumens
Runtime White 7 1.25 hours*

*All performance claims tested to ANSI/NEMA FL1-2008 Standard.

Description

This enhanced version of our best-selling SureFire X300 Ultra now delivers a stunning 1,000 lumens of LED-generated output
focused by a precision TIR lens, creating a far-reaching high intensity beam — with a larger center spot — that offers the power
to positively identify threats at significant distances while temporarily impairing an adversary’s vision. This intense beam also
provides extensive peripheral illumination for maintaining situational awareness.

Activating the X300 Ultra is done via ambidextrous switching located at the rear of body, providing one-finger control — press
the switch on either side for momentary-on activation, flip up or down for constant-on activation. Optional DG grip switches
(for pistols) and a pressure activated XT07 tape switch {for long guns) permit the X300 Ultra to be activated without altering
your grip on your weapon.

The X300 Ultra can be attached to a pistol or a long gun since its Rail-Lock® system permits rapid attachment to and removal
from either Universal or Picatinny rails. Its high-strength aerospace aluminum body is Mil-Spec Hard Anodized for superior
toughness and is O-ring and gasket sealed to make it weatherproof.

Features

Special high-performance LED produces 1,000 lumens

Custom TIR lens creates smooth, far-reaching light with a larger center spot beam

Integral ambidextrous momentary- and constant-on switching

Attaches securely to both Universal and Picatinny accessory rails

IPX7 waterproof to 1 meter for 30 minutes

High-strength aerospace aluminum body, Mil-Spec Hard Anodized for extreme durability

Accepts optional pressure-activated DG and XT remote switches for precision control without atering grip on weapon




SUREFIRE WARRANTY STATEMENT

SureFire warrants that if you—our customer—purchase one of our products, and we determine that it is
defective in material and/or workmanship during your lifetime, we will repair or replace it—no hassle!

Rechargeable batteries and chargers are warranted for two years from the date of purchase.

SureFire warrants our EarPro products to be free from defects in workmanship and materials for a
period of 90 days from the date of purchase.

Our warranty does not cover consumables or normal wear-and-tear— things like batteries draining,
headbands and headpads wearing out, ink cartridges running out, and switches wearing out—or damage
resulting from abuse, alterations, unauthorized repairs, or use contrary to SureFire’s user manuals.

Should you need a replacement product, SureFire reserves the right to replace an obsolete product with
a current production, like model. In the event that any issue with a SureFire product is not covered
under this warranty SureFire can arrange to have the product repaired for a reasonable fee.

Standard Disclaimer

EXCEPT AS SPECIFIED ABOVE OR PROHIBITED BY APPLICABLE LAW: ALL EXPRESS OR IMPLIED
CONDITIONS AND WARRANTIES, INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION, ANY IMPLIED WARRANTY OR
CONDITION OF MERCHANTABILITY OR FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE, OR ACCURACY OF ANY
INFORMATIONAL CONTENT, ARE HEREBY EXCLUDED AND DISCLAIMED BY SUREFIRE; AND IN NO EVENT
WILL SUREFIRE BE LIABLE FOR ANY SPECIAL, DIRECT, INDIRECT, CONSEQUENTIAL, INCIDENTAL OR
PUNITIVE DAMAGES HOWSOEVER ARISING AND REGARDLESS OF THE THEORY OF LIABILITY, EVEN IF
ADVISED OF THE POSSIBILITY OF SUCH DAMAGES. PRODUCTS, PRICES, AVAILABILITY, SPECIFICATIONS,
AND OFFERS ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGE OR CANCELLATION AT ANY TIME WITHOUT NOTICE.

Warranty Claims

For problems with a SureFire product, or to return a product for repair, replacement or refund, please
click here for full information and instructions.
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BID NUMBER:

TITLE:

MICHIGAN

STATEMENT OF NO BID
CITY OF TROY

ITB-COT 19-05

GUN HOLSTERS & LIGHTS %

Please Send or Fax To:
City of Troy Purchasing Department
500 W. Big Beaver Rd.

Troy, Ml 48084

FAX NUMBER: (248) 619-7608

We, the undersigned, have declined to bid on the subject bid for the following reasons:

Check All
That Apply

Reason

Our company does not handle the type of product / service

We cannot meet the specifications nor provide an approved alternate —
please explain below

Our company is not interested in bidding at this time

Job is too small

Job is too large

Cannot be competitive

Liability Issues such as insurance, bonding, indemnification, hold harmless

Insufficient time to respond — please explain below

Our company’s schedule would not permit performance of the specifications

Other — describe below

REMARKS:

COMPANY INFORMATION:

COMPANY NAME:
SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE:

TITLE:
COMPANY:
ADDRESS:

FAX NUMBER:

IMPORTANT NOTE: To qualify as a respondent to the bid, the vendor must submit a bid or return this
completed form.

VENDOR REGISTRATION: The City of Troy uses the MITN website for vendor registration, bid and
tabulation posting, award information and other processes. Final bid results will be posted on the MITN

TELEPHONE NUMBER:

website after award. Please register to see results - - www.mitn.info.
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MICHIGAN

Date: February 26, 2019

To: Mark F. Miller, City Manager

From: MaryBeth Murz, Purchasing Manm

Frank Nastasi, Chief of Police 4227
Andrew Satterfield, Police Lieutenant /- #1023

Subject: Standard Purchasing Resolution 2 — Award to Low Bidder Meeting Specifications —
Gun Holsters and Lights— Police Department

History- v
e Troy Police Department is currently using the Black Hawk Level 1l Serpa Holster and Blaw

Hawk Xiphos NTx Weapon mounted lights (180 lumens) for the Officer’s duty handguns.

« Both pieces of equipment are approximately nine (9) years old.

o The current holster has been the focus of studies that show issues of:

o Inability to draw the weapon - when debris (dirt, snow, or mud) gets lodged in the safety
release, the officer will not be able to draw the weapon out of the holster.

o Accidental discharges - The safety release button is in line with the trigger finger which had
been linked to accidental discharges when drawing the weapon.

o Banned on Federal shooting ranges - Due to the above issues the holster has been banned
on all federal ranges limiting training opportunities for Troy officers.

e In an effort to maintain officer safety and protection of citizens; the Police Department is seeking to
replace the current holster with the Safariland Model 7360 &TS ALS/SLA holster and replace the
current weapon mounted light with the Surefire x300 (1000 Lumens).

o The proposed holster will maintain weapon security while eliminating the issues of failure to
draw malfunction and potential for accidental discharge.

o The current weapon mounted light is showing its age and beginning to malfunction.

o Better LED technology has drastically increased Lumen capability and battery life.

Purchasing
o On February 21, 2019; a bid opening was conducted as required by City Charter/Code and bid

proposals were received at the City’s request from firms interested in providing Gun Holsters and
Lights for the City of Troy Police Department.

« Companies were notified via the Michigan Intergovernmental Trade Network (MITN);
www.mitn.info. One Hundred and Ninety four (194) vendors were notified via the MITN website.




iz CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM

troymi.gov

MICHIGAN

Purchasing (continued)
e Six (6) bid responses were received. Below is a detailed summary of the vendor responses.

MITN provides a resourceful online platform to streamiine the

Companies notified via MITN 194 || procurement process, redtce costs, and make it easier and more
Troy C X ified via MITN transparent for vendors to do business with the City of Troy.
roy Companies notified via MIT 5 Active MITN members with a current membership and paying annual

dues receive automatic electronic notification which allows instant access

Troy Companies notified Active email Notification
y L fi to Bids, RFPS and Quote opportunities with the City.

Troy Companies - Active Free 0 Active MITN non-paying members are responsible to monitor and check
. . . the MITN website for opportunities to do business with the City.

Companies that viewed the bid 22 || Jnactive MITN member status can occur when a company does not

Troy Companies that viewed the bid 0 renew their account upon expiration. Inactive members cannot be notified

of solicitations or access any bid information.

e A detailed description of value, weapons specifications, and quantities are detailed in the attached
bid summary.

e The low bidder did not offer any warranty on the holsters and lights as specified. Therefore, Vance
Outdoors, Inc. of Columbus. OH is the low bidder meeting specifications with an estimated total of
$36,402.85. Vance Outdoors Inc. also has very favorable references.

Financial ,

Funds are budgeted and available in the General Fund under the Police Department
Investigative/Administrative Services Emergency Response Preparedness, account number
101.301.11.324.7740.010 for the 2019 fiscal year for the Holster and weapon light replacement.

Recommendation
City Management recommends awarding a contract to the low bidder meeting specifications; Vance

Outdoors, Inc. of Columbus, OH, to supply the Police Department with the Gun Holsters and Lights
for an estimated total amount of $36,402.85.

G: /BidAward18-19StandardPurchasingResolution2-HolstersandLights-PD




Opening Date; 2/21/2019
Reviewed Date: 2/21/2019

Vendor Name:

Botach Inc.

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION
GUN HOLSTERS & LIGHTS

Vance Outdoors, Inc.

ITB-COT 19-05
Page 1 of 2

Acme Sports, Inc.

Las Vegas, NV

Columbu

s, OH

Seymour, [N

PROPOSAL: FURNISH GUN HOLSTERS AND LIGHTS FOR THE CITY OF TROY POLICE DEPARTM

ENT.

Est.
QTY

Description

Unit Cost | Total Cost

Unit Cost | Total Cost

Unit Cost | Total ébst

98

Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level lll Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-481

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5

Barrel Length: 4.5" Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

Finish: Basket Weve

$102.17 | $10,012.68

$100.55 | $9,8563.90

$109.00 |$10,682.00

11

Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level lll Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-482

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5

Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

Finish; Basket Weve

$102.17 $1,123.87

$100.55 | $1,106.05

$109.00 $1,199.00

11

Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level lil Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-411

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5

Barrel Length: 4.5" Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

Finish: Plain

$102.17 $1,123.87

$100.55 $1,106.05

$109.00 $1,189.00

Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level lli Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-412

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5 Barrel Length: 4.5”

Caliber: 9mmColor Light: Surefire x300u

Color: Black Material: Safari seven

Finish: Plain

$102.17 $102.17

$100.55 $100.55

$109.00 $108.00

121

Surefire x300U-A
1,000 Lumens Led Handgun Light with T-Slot
Mounting Rail

$187.59 | $22,698.39

$200.30 |$24,236.30

$197.30 | $23,873.30

Grand Total:

$35,060.96

$36,402.85

$37,062.30

Lead Time

Warranty
Insurance Met:

YorN
YorN
YorN

Exceptions:

Acknowledgement:
Forms:
References:

YorN
YorN
YorN

30-60 Days

30-60 Days

4-6 Weeks

N

Y

Y

Y

Y

Y

Wil hold Safariland price
till 3/31/2020. Will hold
Surefire prices ill
12/31/2019.

Y

Y

<i=<|=

Y

<|<|<




Opening Date: 2/21/2019
Reviewed Date: 2/21/2019

Vendor Name:
CITY:

CITY OF TROY
BID TABULATION
GUN HOLSTERS & LIGHTS

CMP Distributors, Inc.

Kiesler Police Supply, Inc.

ITB-COT 19-05
Page 2 of 2

Dinges Fire Co.

Lansing, Ml

Jeffersonville, IN

- Pinckney, Mi

PROPOSAL: FURNISH GUN HOLSTERS AND LIGHTS FOR THE CITY OF TROY POL

ICE DEPARTMENT.

j =3

Description

Unit Cost | Total Cost

Unit Cost | Total Cost

Unit Cost | Total Cost

OTNL

Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level lil Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-481

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 6

Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

Finish: Basket Weve

98

$119.30 | $11,691.40

No bid

Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level lil Retention Duty Holster

Part; 7360-832-482

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5

Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9mm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

11

$119.30 $1,312.30

No bid

Right Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level lll Retention Duty Holster

Part: 7360-832-411

Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5

Barrel Length: 4.5” Caliber: 9Smm

Light: Surefire x300u Color: Black

Material: Safariseven

Finish: Plain

11

$119.30 $1,312.30

No bid

Left Handed Safariland Model 7360 7TS ALS/SLA
Mid-Ride Level 1ll Retention Duty Holster

Part; 7360-832-412

1 |Pistol: Glock 17 Gen 5 Barrel Length: 4.5"
Caliber: 9mmColor Light; Surefire x300u

Color: Black Material: Safari seven

Finish: Plain

$119.30 $119.30

No bid

Surefire x300U-A
1,000 Lumens Led Handgun Light with T-Slot
Mounting Rail

121

$216.55 | $26,202.55

20148 |$24,379.08

Grand Total:

$40,637.85

$24,379.08

Lead Time
Warranty
Insurance Met:
Exceptions:
Acknowledgement:
Forms:
References:

YorN
YorN
YorN
YorN
YorN
YorN

ATTEST:

Sue Riesterer
Kristine Kaliek
Larysa Figol

30-45 Days

30 Days

<|=<]<]=z|<|<

<i=<|=<|=Z]=<}<

W ez

Late Bid submifted.

MaryBeth Murz,
Purchasing Manager




STANDARD PURCHASING RESOLUTION 2 - Low Bidder Meeting Specifications —
Gun Holsters and Lights for the Troy Police Department

RESOLVED, That Troy City Council hereby AWARDS a contract to the low bidder
meeting specifications; Vance Outdoors, Inc. of Columbus, OH, to supply the Police
Department with Gun Holsters and Lights for an estimated total cost of $36,402.85 not
to exceed budgetary limitations at the unit prices as contained in the bid tabulation
opened February 21, 2019, a copy of which shall be ATTACHED to the original

Minutes of this meeting.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the award is contingent upon contractor’s
submission of properly executed contract documents, including insurance certificates
and all other specified requirements.
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AC’(;;?)Q DATE (MMDDYYYY)
CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 211972019

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER, THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate hoider is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed,
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement, A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER ETEACT Ginny Peters
Commercial Lines - (614) 640-6100 FHONE . 614.407.7535 | m’é. noj: 610.537.2008
UsI Insurance Services LLC EMAL <. ginny.peters@usi.com
Atrium 2, South Tower 5455 Rings Road, Suite 250 INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
Dublin, OH 43017 INSURERA: Cincinnali Insurance Campany 10677
INSURED INSURER B ;
Vance Outdoors, Inc INSURER C 1
3723 Cleveland Avenue INSURER D :
‘ INSURERE :
Columbus, OH 43224 INSURER F : i
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 13898251 REVISION NUMBER: See below

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN 18 SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

ADDLISUBH| B P
i) TYPE OF INSURANCE NSD | wen POLICY NUMBER MO T v | (DO FY) LmiTS
A X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY X EPP0495955 8/1/2018 8/1/2019 | EACH 0C$32RE$H%% $ 500,000
j CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence) | $ 500,000
L Conlractual Liab MEDEXP {Any ons parson) | § 10,000
X | Independeni Conlractors PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $ 500,000
| GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE s 500.000
X Jrouey] 158% [ Jiee PRODUGTS - COMPIOP AGG | § 500,000
OTHER: Ohlo Stop Gap $ 500,000
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY X CPA0495955 8/1/2018 | 8/1/2019 | Goroiel SINGLETHIT 500000
X | ANy ayTo BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
% | OWNED SCHEDULED -
[ X | QD sy [ ] 35uen BODILY INJURY (Per accident)] §
x| HRED X | NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE s
| X 1§ AuTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY {Pei accident)
$
A | X |UMBRELLALIAB | X | necyr X EPP0495955 81/2018 | 8/1/2018 | EACH OCCURRENGE s 10,000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAMS-MADE AGGREGATE $ 10,000,000
peo | | Retentions __ﬁ 5
WORKERS COMPENSATION FER O
AND EMPLOYERS’ LIABILITY YIN ERrore | [ X
ANYPROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE E.L EACH ACCIDENT $
QFFICERIMEMBEREXCLUDED? NIA
{Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - £A EMPLOYEE] §
If yes, describe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below EL DISEASE - POLICY LMIT | §
A | Ohio Employers Liabiity EPP0495955 8//2018 | 8/1/2019 | ss00.000 :

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS /LOCATIONS | VEHICLES (ACORD 104, Additional Remarks Schaduls, may he attuched if more space is required)

RE: Gun Holsters & Lights Bid.

The City of Troy inctuding all elected and appointed officials, all employees and volunteers, all boards, commissions, and/or authorities and council
members, including empioyees and volunteers thereof. it is understood and agreed by naming the City of Troy as additional insured, coverage atforded is
considered to be primary and any other insurance the City of Troy may have in effect shall be considerad secondary and/or excess as it pertains to general
and auto liability in accordance with the terms and conditions of the policy. Certificate holder is provided 30 days notice of cancallation, 10 days for non
payment of premium in accordance with the terms and conditions of the policy. Includes Broad Form General Liabiiity.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
City of Troy SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
Purchasig Manager ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
500 West Big Beaver
Troy, Mi 48084 AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
9(“"&-.4._
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DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

N k
ACORD CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 01/29/2019

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the
certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER GONIACT SCOTT SHEAKLEY
TEE & GEE UNDERWRITING MANAGERS, LP FHONE  £xy: 513-618-1350 | FA% no): 877-434-2730
8131 LBJ FREEWAY ' A 5. SCOTT.SHEAKLEY@SHEAKLEY.COM
SUITE 750 INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
DALLAS, TX 75251 insuReR A : STATE NATIONAL INSURANCE GOMPANY 12831
INSURED INSURER B :
SHEAKLEY HR, LLC INSURER C :
ONE SHEAKLEY WAY INSURER D :
CINCINNATI, OH 45246 INSURERE :
INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOGUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANGCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUGED BY PAID GLAIMS.

INSR ADDL|SUBR POLICY EFF POLICY EXP

TR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | WD POLICY NUMBER (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS
COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENGE $
DAMAGE TO RENTED
CLAIMS-MADE D OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence) | $
MED EXP {Any one person) $
PERSONAL & ADVINJURY | §
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $
POLICY D g D LOC PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | §
OTHER: $
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY GOMBINED SINGLELIMIT [ ¢
ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
ALL OWNED SCHEDULED -
| AuTos A Swneo rapERTY oA
HIRED AUTOS AUTOS {Per accident} $
$
UMBRELLA LIAR OCCUR EACH OGGURRENCE $
EXCESS LIAB GCLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $
DED I I RETENTION $ $
WORKERS COMPENSATION PER OTH-

A | AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN X ' STATUTE ER
gﬁ;{gggﬁéﬁ@g@gﬁgﬁ/g}scuT|ve NJA TGW900025202 8/20/2018 | 8/20/2019 | E.L. EACH AGGIDENT $ 1000000
(Mandatory in NH) ) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE] § 1000000
If yes, describe under
DESGRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § 1000000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

ALTERNATE EMPLOYER, VANCE OUTDOORS, INC, IS PROVIDED WORKERS COMPENSATION COVERAGE

EFFECTIVE 1/1/2019 ONLY FOR EMPLOYEES LEASED FROM SHEAKLEY HR LLC PURSUANT TO THE CLIENT SERVICES
AGREEMENT BETWEEN VANCE OUTDOORS, INC AND SHEAKLEY HRLLC

COVERAGE INCLUDES THE FOLLOWING STATES: IN, KY, WV, & M|

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANGELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESGRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN

Vance Outdoors, Inc. ACCORDANCE WiTH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
3723 Cleveland Ave.
Columbus, OH 43224 AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
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